
22-Sep-05

Quantity unit price total unit price total unit price total
2000 each $25.57 $51,140.00 $24.00 $48,000.00 No Bid
20 each $152.00 $3,040.00 No Bid $168.00 $3,080.00
80 each $192.00 $15,360.00 No Bid $173.00 $12,320.00
80 each $192.00 $15,360.00 No Bid $173.00 $12,320.00
20 each $192.00 $3,840.00 No Bid No Bid

Grand Total $88,740.00 $48,000.00 $27,720.00

Vendor quoted an Electronic  Meter
Specs called for a Cyclometer.

$58,020.00 $24,640.00

$82,660.00Total Award

Recommended Award

*Not an Approved mftr.
does not meet specifications

Class 200 Meter 240V 1PH

Manufacturer - ABB

Class 320 Meter 240V 1PH

Class 200 Meter 120/277 3PH
Class 20 Meter 120/277 3PH

Class 200 Meter 120/277 3KJ

Manufacturer - Sensus Manufacturer - LANDIS+GYR

Annual Electric Meters
Bid No. 05-149         

WESCO FAPCo, LLC* Texas Meter & Device


