
 TransAmerican Power Products c/o UtiliCor
Angela Thompson

Item Number Item Description Quantity Unit Price UOM Notes Total
A-1 Prestressed Spun Cast Concrete Pole, 75'      5 $0.00 ea $0.00
A-2 Prestressed Spun Cast Concrete Pole, 80'      1 $0.00 ea $0.00
A-3 Prestressed Spun Cast Concrete Pole, 80'      1 $0.00 ea $0.00
A-4 Prestressed Spun Cast Concrete Pole, 85'      1 $0.00 ea $0.00
A-5 Prestressed Spun Cast Concrete Pole, 90'      18 $0.00 ea $0.00
A-6 Prestressed Spun Cast Concrete Pole, 90'      1 $0.00 ea $0.00
A-7 Prestressed Spun Cast Concrete Pole, 90'      2 $0.00 ea $0.00
B-1 Above Ground Steel Pole, 76' per Specs 2 $17,654.10 ea 7-9 weeks delivery $35,308.20
B-2 Above Ground Steel Pole, 76' per Specs 1 $33,380.90 ea 7-9 weeks delivery $33,380.90
B-3 Steel Pole, 75' per Specs 5 $6,951.80 ea 7-9 weeks delivery $34,759.00
B-4 Steel Pole, 80' per Specs 1 $8,166.70 ea 7-9 weeks delivery $8,166.70
B-5 Steel Pole, 80' per Specs 1 $8,172.10 ea 7-9 weeks delivery $8,172.10
B-6 Steel Pole, 85' per Specs 1 $13,060.60 ea 7-9 weeks delivery $13,060.60
B-7 Steel Pole, 90' per Specs 18 $8,998.10 ea 7-9 weeks delivery $161,965.80
B-8 Steel Pole, 90' per Specs 1 $9,512.30 ea 7-9 weeks delivery $9,512.30
B-9 Steel Pole, 90' per Specs 2 $9,428.40 ea 7-9 weeks delivery $18,856.80

Grand Total $323,182.40
Specify Desc. Response
Prompt Pay NA

Valmont / Newark - John Jongebloed

Item Number Item Description Quantity Unit Price UOM Notes Total
A-1 Prestressed Spun Cast Concrete Pole, 75'      5 $3,143.00 ea $15,715.00
A-2 Prestressed Spun Cast Concrete Pole, 80'      1 $3,265.00 ea $3,265.00
A-3 Prestressed Spun Cast Concrete Pole, 80'      1 $3,309.00 ea $3,309.00
A-4 Prestressed Spun Cast Concrete Pole, 85'      1 $4,453.00 ea $4,453.00
A-5 Prestressed Spun Cast Concrete Pole, 90'      18 $4,031.00 ea $72,558.00
A-6 Prestressed Spun Cast Concrete Pole, 90'      1 $4,031.00 ea $4,031.00
A-7 Prestressed Spun Cast Concrete Pole, 90'      2 $4,486.00 ea $8,972.00
B-1 Above Ground Steel Pole, 76' per Specs 2 $12,644.00 ea $25,288.00
B-2 Above Ground Steel Pole, 76' per Specs 1 $31,309.00 ea $31,309.00
B-3 Steel Pole, 75' per Specs 5 No Bid ea No Bid
B-4 Steel Pole, 80' per Specs 1 No Bid ea No Bid
B-5 Steel Pole, 80' per Specs 1 No Bid ea No Bid
B-6 Steel Pole, 85' per Specs 1 No Bid ea No Bid
B-7 Steel Pole, 90' per Specs 18 No Bid ea No Bid
B-8 Steel Pole, 90' per Specs 1 No Bid ea No Bid
B-9 Steel Pole, 90' per Specs 2 No Bid ea No Bid

Grand Total $168,900.00
Prompt Pay NA

Staff Award Recommendation

BID TABULATION #05-133 TRANSMISSION POLES AT SPRING CREEK SUBSTATION


