
Annual Bid for Heavy Machinery Rental 
Bid Tabulation #05-89

Item Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
No. Description Monthly Weekly Daily Monthly Weekly Daily Monthly Weekly Daily

Loaders
1 Backhoe/Loader & accessories; 74 HP $1,425.00 $525.00 $185.00 $1,200.00 $550.00 $185.00 $2,045.00 $1,090.00 $770.00
2 Backhoe/Loader & accessories; 100 HP No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Backhoe/Loader & accessories; 74 HP (4x4) $1,650.00 $670.00 $250.00 $1,300.00 $600.00 $200.00 $2,045.00 $1,090.00 $770.00
4 Backhoe/Loader & accessories; 100 HP (4x4) No Bid No Bid No Bid

5
Backhoe/Loader & accessories; 74 HP w/1000# 
Hammer $4,800.00 $1,630.00 $540.00 $2,800.00 $1,200.00 $400.00 $4,655.00 $1,955.00 $1,055.00

6
Backhoe/Loader and accessories; 100 HP w/1000# 
Hammer No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 Backhoe/Loader and accessories; 74 HP w/Extendahoe $1,735.00 $680.00 $265.00 $1,400.00 $600.00 $225.00 $2,225.00 $1,145.00 $785.00

8
Backhoe/Loader and accessories; 100 HP 
w/Extendahoe No Bid No Bid No Bid

9
Backhoe/Loader and accessories 74 HP w/Extendahoe, 
18' 2" digging depth $1,565.00 $610.00 $205.00 $1,400.00 $600.00 $225.00 $2,225.00 $1,145.00 $785.00

10
Backhoe 74 HP - w/IT tool carrier w/ldr. Bucket and 
forks $1,675.00 $575.00 $195.00 No Bid No Bid

11 Skid Steer Loader - 70 HP - 5700 lbs. $1,235.00 $425.00 $140.00 $1,100.00 $450.00 $140.00 No Bid
12 Track Skid Steer Loader - 70 HP - 6000 lbs. No Bid No Bid No Bid

Loader Box Blade Tractors
13 Tractor w/1 yd. loader bucket & box blade $1,300.00 $495.00 $165.00 No Bid No Bid
14 Tractor (4x4) w/1yd. Loader bucket & hyd box blade No Bid $1,400.00 $550.00 $175.00 No Bid

Wheel & Track Mini Skid Loaders
15 Wheel skid steer - 58 HP - Wt. 5700 lbs $1,235.00 $425.00 $140.00 $1,100.00 $450.00 $140.00 No Bid
16 Mini track loader - 58 HP - wt. 6665 $2,500.00 $835.00 $285.00 No Bid No Bid

Skid Steer Atttachments
17 Cold planner $4,350.00 $1,450.00 $485.00 No Bid No Bid
18 Hydraulic auger $650.00 $220.00 $65.00 $400.00 $150.00 $50.00 No Bid
19 Hydraulic hammer $850.00 $280.00 $95.00 $900.00 $450.00 $150.00 No Bid
20 Stump grinder $1,460.00 $490.00 $165.00 No Bid No Bid

Mini Excavators
21 Cat 301.5 (or equal) 7' depth -11'10" Reach $1,495.00 $495.00 $165.00 $1,100.00 $450.00 $150.00 $1,955.00 $1,055.00 $760.00
22 Cat 303.5 (or equal) 11'7' depth- 18'5" Reach $1,800.00 $600.00 $200.00 $1,200.00 $500.00 $160.00 $2,270.00 $1,165.00 $790.00
23 Wt. 3434 lbs - 7' depth - 11'10" Reach $1,495.00 $495.00 $165.00 No Bid No Bid
24 Wt. 5672 lbs - 8'8" depth - 15' Reach $1,685.00 $560.00 $185.00 No Bid $1,955.00 $1,055.00 $760.00
25 Wt. 7676 lbs - 11'7" depth - 18'5" Reach $1,800.00 $600.00 $200.00 No Bid $2,270.00 $1,165.00 $790.00

Excavators
26 16,380 lbs - 22' " Reach - 15'3" Depth $2,600.00 $865.00 $285.00 No Bid No Bid
27 29,150 lbs - 28'4" Reach  - 19'10" Depth $3,285.00 $1,100.00 $370.00 No Bid $3,975.00 $1,880.00 $1,185.00
28 37,000 lbs - 30' Reach - 21'6" Depth $3,850.00 $1,285.00 $430.00 No Bid $4,335.00 $1,995.00 $1,225.00
29 40,480 lbs - 31'6" Reach - 29'9" Depth $4,000.00 $1,350.00 $450.00 No Bid No Bid
30 45,000 lbs  - 35.1' Reach - 25'11 Depth  $4,300.00 $1,450.00 $495.00 No Bid $5,055.00 $2,250.00 $1,300.00
31 45,000 lbs  - 35.1' Reach - 25'11 Depth w/thumb $5,095.00 $1,785.00 $595.00 No Bid No Bid
32 60,600 lbs - 34.7" Reach - 23'4" Depth $6,400.00 $2,175.00 $725.00 No Bid $6,675.00 $2,780.00 $1,480.00
33 76,300 lbs - 38.3" Reach - 26'6" Depth $7,900.00 $2,700.00 $900.00 No Bid $8,100.00 $3,370.00 $1,785.00

Wheel Excavators
34 40,000 lbs - 151 HP - 30'1" Reach - 19'2" Depth $6,130.00 $2,045.00 $685.00 No Bid No Bid

Specialty Excavators
35 45,500 lbs - w/5000 lb hammer $14,500.00 $4,850.00 $1,625.00 No Bid $12,325.00 $4,585.00 $2,085.00
36 45,500 lbs - w/Pin n Thumb attachment $5,095.00 $1,785.00 $595.00 No Bid No Bid
37 Long Reach - w/60' Reach - 45' Depth $9,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,000.00 No Bid $8,640.00 $3,550.00 $1,845.00
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Dozers
38 70 HP Dozer w / 6-way Blade $2,300.00 $785.00 $260.00 No Bid No Bid
39 80 HP Dozer w / 6-way Blade $2,700.00 $900.00 $300.00 No Bid No Bid
40 90 HP Dozer w / 6-way Blade $3,050.00 $1,035.00 $345.00 $2,500.00 $1,100.00 $300.00 No Bid
41 110 HP Dozer w / 6-way Blade $3,800.00 $1,270.00 $450.00 $2,800.00 $1,250.00 $400.00 No Bid
42 140 HP Dozer w / 6-way Blade $5,400.00 $1,800.00 $600.00 No Bid No Bid
43 48,000 lbs - 175 HP dozer w/straight blade w/tilt $6,850.00 $2,295.00 $765.00 No Bid No Bid
44 48,000 lbs - 175 HP clearing dozer rake $7,300.00 $2,495.00 $830.00 No Bid No Bid

45
140 HP Dozer w / Straight Blade w / Tilt with Rake for 
Clearing $6,200.00 $2,100.00 $700.00 No Bid No Bid

46
175 HP Cat D6R-XL Dozer (or equal) with Straight 
Blade w / Tilt $6,850.00 $2,295.00 $765.00 No Bid No Bid

Low Ground Pressure Dozers
47 70 HP LGP Dozer w / 6-way Blade $3,000.00 $1,000.00 $325.00 No Bid No Bid
48 80 HP LGP Dozer w/ 6-way Blade $3,800.00 $1,270.00 $425.00 No Bid No Bid
49 90 HP LGP Dozer w/6-way Blade 19,700 lbs $4,050.00 $1,350.00 $450.00 No Bid No Bid
50 110 HP LGP Dozer w / 6-way Blade $4,500.00 $1,500.00 $500.00 No Bid No Bid
51 140 HP LGP Dozer w / 6-way Blade $6,500.00 $2,230.00 $745.00 No Bid No Bid
52 175 HLGP Dozer w/ straight Blade w / Tilt $7,900.00 $2,700.00 $900.00 No Bid No Bid
53 175 HP LGP Dozer w/straight Blade w/ Tilt CAB $8,500.00 $2,925.00 $975.00 No Bid No Bid

Landscape Tractor
54 40 HP Tractor Box Blade / Front End Loader 4x4 No Bid $1,400.00 $550.00 $175.00 No Bid

Wheel Loaders
55 2 Yard Bucket - 105 HP $2,800.00 $945.00 $315.00 $2,600.00 $1,200.00 $300.00 $3,885.00 $1,850.00 $1,175.00
56 2.5 Yard Bucket - 120 HP $3,200.00 $1,070.00 $360.00 No Bid $4,245.00 $1,975.00 $1,210.00
57 3 Yard Bucket - 140 HP $4,075.00 $1,360.00 $460.00 No Bid No Bid
58 4 Yard Bucket - 140 HP $5,175.00 $1,725.00 $575.00 No Bid No Bid

Crawler Loaders
59 2.3 Yard Bucket - 120 HP $4,900.00 $1,625.00 $550.00 No Bid No Bid
60 2.6 Yard Bucket - 160 HP ROPS $6,800.00 $2,300.00 $775.00 No Bid No Bid
61 2.6 Yard Bucket - 160 HP w/CAB $7,100.00 $2,400.00 $8,000.00 No Bid No Bid
62 Disc Plows - 36 Hinge Offset $1,575.00 $525.00 $175.00 No Bid No Bid

Scrapers
63 11 Cubic Yard Self Loading No Bid No Bid No Bid
64 17 Cubic Yard Self Loading No Bid No Bid No Bid
65 22 Cubic Yard Self Loading No Bid No Bid No Bid
66 Pneumatic Compactor - 9 wheel 14 ton $2,075.00 $690.00 $230.00 No Bid $2,495.00 $1,235.00 $825.00

Pad Drum Compactors
67 48" Signle Vibratory Drum $2,250.00 $750.00 $2,500.00 No Bid $2,990.00 $1,405.00 $875.00
68 66" Single Vibratory Drum - 14 Ton $2,900.00 $970.00 $325.00 No Bid $3,485.00 $1,570.00 $903.00
69 84" Single Vibratory Drum - 25 Ton $3,825.00 $1,275.00 $410.00 No Bid $4,385.00 $2,015.00 $1,225.00

Smooth Drum Compactors
70 66" Single Vibratory Drum - 107 HP $2,600.00 $870.00 $290.00 No Bid $3,305.00 $1,505.00 $905.00
71 84" Single Vibratory Drum - 145 HP $3,675.00 $1,220.00 $400.00 No Bid $4,385.00 $2,015.00 $1,225.00

Asphalt Equipment
72 47" Static Steel Drum Roller $1,700.00 $5,750.00 $1,900.00 No Bid $2,045.00 $1,100.00 $785.00
73 Asphalt Recycler, Bomag MPH100 or equal No Bid No Bid $12,825.00 $4,825.00 $2,825.00
74 Pulber Mixer - 335 HP - 8' Drum Soil Stabilizer $8,235.00 $2,775.00 $925.00 No Bid $8,825.00 $3,495.00 $2,160.00
75 Water Truck - 2000 Gallon Power Spray System $2,550.00 $930.00 $310.00 No Bid No Bid
76 Self Propelled Mechanical Broom $1,495.00 $510.00 $170.00 No Bid $2,225.00 $1,145.00 $785.00
77 Cab and Air $7,900.00 $2,650.00 $875.00 No Bid No Bid
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Motor Graders
78 Fiat Allias 65C (or equal) 68 HP 10' Moldboard $2,700.00 $900.00 $300.00 No Bid $3,390.00 $1,680.00 $1,115.00
79 Cat 135H (or equal) 135 HP - 14' Moldboard $4,600.00 $1,575.00 $525.00 No Bid $4,965.00 $2,215.00 $1,295.00

Articulated Off Road Trucks
80 25 Ton Off Road Truck $7,750.00 $2,850.00 $950.00 No Bid No Bid
81 30 Ton Off Road Truck No Bid No Bid No Bid

Forklifts
82 6000 lb. Straight Mask Rought Terrain w / 21' Lift $1,585.00 $525.00 $175.00 $1,200.00 $500.00 $150.00 No Bid
83 7000 lb. Tele Handler - 37' Lift - 23' $2,250.00 $760.00 $255.00 $1,800.00 $650.00 $200.00 No Bid
84 8000 lb. Tele Handler - 40' Lift - 25' $2,475.00 $840.00 $280.00 $2,300.00 $850.00 $250.00 No Bid

Trenchers
85 Remote 24/33 Width - Diesel $1,800.00 $600.00 $200.00 No Bid No Bid
86 Walk Behind 24/33 Width - Diesel $1,485.00 $580.00 $190.00 No Bid No Bid

Trash Pumps
87 2" Gasoline - w / Hoses $350.00 $120.00 $41.00 No Bid No Bid
88 3" Gasoline - w / Hoses $440.00 $150.00 $52.00 No Bid No Bid
89 4" Diesel - Trailer Mounted w / Hoses No Bid No Bid No Bid
90 6" Diesel - Trailer Mounted w / Hoses $2,000.00 $675.00 $225.00 No Bid No Bid

Air Compressors
91 100 CFM - Diesel Trailer Mounted w / Hoses No Bid No Bid No Bid
92 185 CFM - Deisel Trailer Mounted w / Hoses $700.00 $250.00 $80.00 No Bid No Bid
93 250 CFM - Diesel Trailer Mounted w / Hoses $850.00 $300.00 $110.00 No Bid No Bid
94 375 CFM - Diesel Trailer Mounted w / Hoses $1,200.00 $495.00 $150.00 No Bid No Bid
95 Portable Light Tower $665.00 $230.00 $78.00 $550.00 $225.00 $90.00 No Bid

Generators
96 3600 Watts $385.00 $130.00 $44.00 No Bid No Bid
97 6000 Watts $495.00 $166.00 $55.00 No Bid No Bid
98 15 KW - Trailer Mounted No Bid No Bid No Bid
99 20 KW - Trailer Mounted $895.00 $300.00 $100.00 No Bid No Bid
100 32 KW - Trailer Mounted $1,265.00 $425.00 $140.00 No Bid No Bid

Trench Compators
101 Rammax (or equal) Remot 24 / 33 Width $1,800.00 $600.00 $200.00 No Bid No Bid
102 Rammax (or equal) Walk Behind 24 / 33 Width $1,485.00 $580.00 $190.00 No Bid No Bid
103 Tamper - Multiquip MT5 / MT85 (or equal) $495.00 $165.00 $55.00 No Bid No Bid

Motor Graders
104 68 HP Articulated - 1/10' Moldboard $2,700.00 $900.00 $300.00 No Bid $3,390.00 $1,680.00 $1,115.00
105 125 HP Articulated - 12' Moldboard $3,600.00 $1,230.00 $410.00 No Bid $4,605.00 $2,085.00 $1,250.00
106 135 HP Articulated - 14' Moldboard $4,600.00 $1,575.00 $525.00 No Bid No Bid
107 140 HP Articulated - 14' Moldboard & Sacrifer $4,875.00 $1,625.00 $540.00 No Bid No Bid
108 165 HP Articulated - 14' Moldboard & Sacrifer/Ripper $5,150.00 $1,800.00 $600.00 No Bid $4,965.00 $2,215.00 $1,295.00

Integrated Carrier Loader
109 105 HP - 1.75 yd Bucket w/Forks $3,100.00 $1,050.00 $350.00 No Bid $3,975.00 $1,925.00 $1,185.00
110 125 HP - 2.25 yd Bucket w/Forks $3,500.00 $1,200.00 $400.00 No Bid $4,425.00 $2,025.00 $1,225.00
111 140 HP - 2.75 yd Bucket w/Forks $4,300.00 $1,380.00 $460.00 No Bid No Bid

Disc Plows - 36 Hinge Offset
112 Plow - 16x30/Plow 16/32 $1,575.00 $525.00 $175.00 No Bid No Bid

Rammers
113 Tamper - Multiquip MT5 / MT85 (or equal) $495.00 $165.00 $55.00 No Bid No Bid

Vibratory Plate Compactors
114 Multiquip - 17" to a 19"x17" to 22" 3350 Centrifugal $450.00 $150.00 $50.00 No Bid No Bid

Reversible Vibratory Plate Compactors
115 Multiquip - MVH 2000GH - 8 HP $1,150.00 $3,850.00 $1,300.00 No Bid No Bid

Welders
116 Lincoln 250 Amps & Multiquip 300 Amps $495.00 $165.00 $55.00 No Bid No Bid
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Delivery Charge

Pick Up Charge

Fuel Charge per gallon 
Charge for Cleaning Equipment if Returned Dirty
Delivery ARO
Location of Nearest Branch 8211 Red Bluff Rd., Pasadena, TX

NOTES/EXCEPTIONS a.  Overtime rates included in bid price.
Cities to supply insurance.  a.  Overtime - after 8 hrs. on days rent, after b.  Minimum rental period is one day.

40 on week, after 176 on month. c.  "Rain Days" included in rental price.
b.  One day = minimum rental period d.  Transportation & delivery included in bid.
c.  Rain days = if notified in am, taken into e.  Response time in emergencies, if 
consideration available, 4-8 hours ARO.
d.  Emergency response - 30 minutes to 1 hr.
e.  Month = 30 days (prorated thereafter)

30 minutes to 1 day

$50.00 for units 100 HP & Less
$75.00 for units 101 HP & Higher

$3.25
$115.00/Hour 

$75.00 for units 101 HP & Higher

1275 N. Harvey Mitchell Pkw., Bryan, TX

$75.00
 

$75.00

$3.00
$40.00/Hour

1 day
4100 IH 35 South, Waco, TX

$50.00 for units 100 HP & Less

2-5 days

Included in Bid Price

Included in Bid Price

$2.88
N/A
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