ANNUAL BID FOR VARIOUS ELECTRICAL DISTRIBUTION MATERIALS
DEPARTMENT: Public Utilities / Electrical Division

BID: #05-58
KBS Electrical Distributor Techline, Inc. Priester Supply Co. Hughes Supply Wesco
Marvin Oldham Kelly McGill Chris Garner Jason Leake Mark Davis
979.822.1093 512.615.8127 817.640.6363 877.270.3390 210.225.0492
Item | Est. | Unit Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item
No. [Quan.| Meas. Description City Inventory # Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Manufacture  Delivery
Group A--15 kV URD Cable Accessories Low Unit Cost
1 50 EA |Deadbreak T-Body Connector 285-022-00031 94.90 4,745.00 115.00 5,750.00 91.94 4,597.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 91.94|Cooper 16-18 wk
2 50 EA |Deadbreak T-Body Connector 285-022-00030 146.65 7,332.50 134.00 6,700.00 145.07 7,253.50 No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid 134.00|Elastimold 10-12 wk
3 150 EA |Deadbreak T-OPII Connector 285-022-00033 239.35 35,902.50 209.00 31,350.00 236.79 35,518.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 209.00|Elastimold 10-12 wk
4 20 EA |Deadbreak Junction 285-095-00009 318.00 6,360.00 330.00 6,600.00 311.29 6,225.80 No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid 311.29|Cooper 10-12 wk
5 50 EA |Protective Cap 285-095-00010 54.00 2,700.00 55.00 2,750.00 53.64 2,682.00 No Bid No Bid 58.00 2,900.00 53.64|Cooper 14-16 wk
6 150 EA _|Protective Cap 285-095-00004 19.05 2,857.50 19.10 2,865.00 18.60 2,790.00 No Bid No Bid 23.00 3,450.00 18.60[Cooper 6-8 wk
7 25 EA |Bushing Adaptor 285-095-00011 152.70 3,817.50 139.00 3,475.00 151.19 3,779.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 139.00|Elastimold 8-10 wk
8 500 EA |Loadbreak Elbow 285-082-00001 22.40 11,200.00 22.50 11,250.00 21.99 10,995.00 No Bid No Bid 24.25 12,125.00 21.99|Cooper 20-22 wk
9 50 EA |Loadbreak Elbow 285-082-00002 22.40 1,120.00 23.00 1,150.00 22.34 1,117.00 No Bid No Bid 26.00 1,300.00 22.34|Cooper 20-22 wk
10 40 EA |Loadbreak Junction 285-095-00003 127.00 5,080.00 130.00 5,200.00 126.59 5,063.60 No Bid No Bid 149.00 5,960.00 126.59|Cooper 28-30 wk
11 20 EA |Loadbreak Junction 285-095-00001 103.50 2,070.00 97.00 1,940.00 103.40 2,068.00 No Bid No Bid 123.00 2,460.00 97.00Elastimold 10-12 wk
12 20 EA |Loadbreak Junction 285-095-00002 111.20 2,224.00 115.00 2,300.00 111.19 2,223.80 No Bid No Bid 133.00 2,660.00 111.19|Cooper 28-30 wk
13 [ 400 EA |Loadbreak Bushing Insert 285-095-00006 22.60 9,040.00 20.25 8,100.00 22.39 8,956.00 No Bid No Bid 23.75 9,500.00 20.25|Elastimold stock
14 50 EA |Two-Way Bushing Insert 285-095-00007 101.00 5,050.00 120.00 6,000.00 99.00 4,950.00 No Bid No Bid|  No Bid No Bid 99.00{Cooper 10-12 wk
15 [ 600 EA |Elbow Cable Seal 285-082-00019 15.88 9,528.00 7.00 4,200.00 8.54 5,124.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.00|Elastimold stock
16 100 EA |Elbow Cable Seal 285-082-00020 21.85 2,185.00 10.30 1,030.00 11.87 1,187.00 No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid 10.30Elastimold stk to 4 wk
17 150 EA |Elbow Arrester 285-082-00005 58.00 8,700.00 60.00 9,000.00 57.45 8,617.50 No Bid No Bid 70.00 10,500.00 57.45|Cooper 8-10 wk
18 100 EA |Insulated Standoff Bushing 285-095-00005 34.35 3,435.00 29.00 2,900.00 34.04 3,404.00 No Bid No Bid 41.25 4,125.00 29.00|Elastimold stk to 12 wk
19 100 EA |Parking Stand Arrester 285-082-00022 139.30 13,930.00 140.00 14,000.00 133.40 13,340.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 133.40|Cooper 12-14 wk
20 24 EA |Cable Terminator Cold Shrink Type 285-082-00018 23.60 566.40 39.00 936.00 42.55 1,021.20 No Bid No Bid|  No Bid No Bid 23.60[Joslyn 4wk
21 36 EA |Cable Terminator, Outdoor, 15 kV, 750 MCM |285-082-00023 216.00 7,776.00 No Bid No Bid 156.40 5,030.40 210.79 7,588.44 No Bid No Bid 210.79|Joslyn 35 days low bid does not meet spec
22 100 EA _|Cable Terminator, Pole Type, Outdoor, 1/0 285-082-00003 No Bid No Bid 33.00 3,300.00 18.32 1,832.00 No Bid No Bid|  No Bid No Bid 18.323M 2-4 wk
23 25 EA |Cable Terminator, Pole Type, Outdoor, 4/0 285-082-00016 17.10 427.50 22.00 550.00 32.20 805.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 17.10{Joslyn 4wk
24 100 EA _|Disconnectable Secondary Transf. Conn. 285-008-00008 24.40 2,440.00 34.00 3,400.00 23.31 2,331.00 24.10 2,410.00 No Bid No Bid 23.31Utilco 2wk
25 [ 200 EA |Disconnectable Secondary Transf. Conn. 285-008-00004 20.55 4,110.00 19.75 3,950.00 32.21 6,442.00 33.31 6,662.00 No Bid No Bid 19.75[CMC 6-8 wk
26 50 EA _|Inline Splice, 200 amp, 15 kV, 95 kV BIL 285-076-00002 33.10 1,655.00 22.50 1,125.00 16.81 840.50 No Bid No Bid 34.00 1,700.00 16.813M 2-4 wk
27 100 EA |Inline Splice, 600 amp, 15 kV, 95 kV BIL 285-076-00004 No Bid No Bid 201.00 20,100.00 221.03 22,103.00 No Bid No Bid 266.00 26,600.00 201.00|3M 2-4 wk
28 25 EA |Inline Splice, 200 amp, 15 kV, 95 kV Bil 285-076-00003 36.60 915.00 23.00 575.00 20.56 514.00 No Bid No Bid 38.00 950.00 20.56[3M 2-4 wk
29 150 EA [Underground Faulted Circuit Indicator, | PH |285-111-00001 128.00 19,200.00 No Bid No Bid 71.78 10,767.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 71.78| PDR 8-10 wk low bid does not meet spec, I need to update spec, mim 50 orde
30 150 EA _|Underground Faulted Circuit Indicator, 1 PH [285-111-00002 No Bid No Bid 115.00 17,250.00 122.91 18,436.50 No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid 115.00|AB Chance 4-6 wk
31 150 EA |Underground Faulted Circuit Indicator, 1 PH [285-111-00003 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12291 18,436.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12291 no one bid correct item, do not award
32 [ 200 EA |Disconnectable Secondary Transf. Conn. 285-008-00007 19.98 3,996.00 11.00 2,200.00 13.32 2,664.00 13.77 2,754.00 No Bid No Bid 11.00{CMC 6-8 wk
33 200 EA |Insulated Secondary Connector, 6 hole 285-008-00012 8.40 1,680.00 8.10 1,620.00 8.40 1,680.00 8.70 1,740.00 No Bid No Bid 8.10|CMC 6-8 wk
34 100 EA _|Secondary Connector, 6 hole, 350 MCM 285-008-00014 6.10 610.00 5.20 520.00 5.76 576.00 5.95 595.00 No Bid No Bid 5.20|CMC 6-8 wk
35 50 EA |Splice Re-jacketing Kit, Cold Shrink Type 285-076-00005 37.70 1,885.00 30.75 1,537.50 32.40 1,620.00 No Bid No Bid 37.00 1,850.00 30.75|3M 2-4 wk
TOTAL $182,537.90 $183,623.50 $225,591.55 $21,749.44 $86,080.00
Award $20,193.90 $106,872.50 $68,119.20 $7,588.44
Group B--Padmount Enclosures Boxes
1 30 EA |Padmounted Enclosure, 200 amp 285-045-00005 822.00 24,660.00| 1100.00 33,000.00 775.79 23,273.70 842.09 25,262.70 No Bid No Bid 775.79[Maysteel 10-12 wk need to make sure they included the bushings
2 10 EA _|Padmounted Enclosure, 600 amp 285-045-00006 1128.00 11,280.00| 1750.00 17,500.00] 1134.00 11,340.00| 1278.66 12,786.60 No Bid No Bid 1128.00({Cooper 6-8 wk need to make sure they included the bushings
3 50 EA |Padmounted Enclosure, w/200 amp, 4-way 285-045-00004 399.60 19,980.00 485.00 24,250.00 395.00 19,750.00 425.10 21,255.00 No Bid No Bid 395.00{Cooper 10-12 wk need to make sure they included the bushings
4 15 EA _|Pull Box, 36"X60"X48" 285-045-00007 805.00 12,075.00 870.00 13,050.00 No Bid No Bid| 2030.24 30,453.60 No Bid No Bid 805.00{CDR 3-4 wk minimum order of $7500 for both
5 15 EA |Pull Box, 48"X96"X48" 285-045-00008 1983.00 29,745.00| 2391.00 35,865.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1983.00/CDR 3-4 wk CDR products
6 50 EA |Secondary Pedestal 285-045-00009 79.85 3,992.50 89.00 4,450.00 No Bid No Bid 55.55 2,777.50 No Bid No Bid 55.55
TOTAL $101,732.50 $128,115.00 $54,363.70 $92,535.40 0.00
Award $53,100.00 $43,023.70 $2,777.50
Group C--Padmounted Switchgear
1 2 EA _|Padmounted Switchgear, 600 amp 285-109-00003 No Bid No Bid| 21500.00 43,000.00( 22520.00 45,040.00 No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid 21500.00{G&W 6-8 wk
2 2 EA |Padmounted Switchgear, 600 amp, 3 phase 285-109-00004 No Bid No Bid| 18299.00 36,598.00| 19114.00 38,228.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18299.00(G&W 6-8 wk
3 2 EA _|Padmounted Switchgear, (2) 600 amp, 3 ph  [285-109-00005 No Bid No Bid| 21774.00 43,548.00( 22806.00 45,612.00 No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid 21774.00{G&W 6-8 wk
TOTAL 0.00 0.00 $123,146.00 $128,880.00 0.00 0.00
Award $123,146.00
Total Award Recommendation to Vendor $ $73,293.90 $230,018.50 $111,142.90 $10,365.94
Grand Total Award: $424,821.24
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