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Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
Group I:  PVC Fittings Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

Item No.
Annual Est. 
Qty. UOM Inventory # Description

1 160 ea 285-019-00001 PVC, Sch 40, 90 Degree, Bend, 1” Carlon #UA9CF or equal (Inventory #285-019-00001) $2.73 $436.80 $4.99 $798.40 $4.04 $646.40 $2.48 $396.80 $3.72 $595.20 $0.41 $65.60
2 320 ea 285-019-00002 PVC, Sch 40, 45 Degree, Bend, 2” Carlon #UA7CJ or equal (Inventory #285-019-00002) $2.44 $780.80 $6.30 $2,016.00 $4.43 $1,417.60 $2.31 $739.20 $3.53 $1,129.60 $1.02 $326.40
3 1000 ea 285-019-00003 PVC, Sch 40, 90 Degree, Bend, 2” Carlon #UA9CJ or equal (Inventory #285-019-00003) $3.30 $3,300.00 $5.99 $5,990.00 $5.03 $5,030.00 $3.73 $3,730.00 $4.53 $4,530.00 $1.08 $1,080.00
4 50 ea 285-019-00004 PVC, Sch 40, 45 Degree, Bend, 4” Picoma #MUA7AN or equal (Inventory #285-019-00004) $6.98 $349.00 $6.25 $312.50 $7.31 $365.50 $6.56 $328.00 $6.25 $312.50 $5.50 $275.00
5 260 ea 285-019-00005 PVC, Sch 40, 90 Degree, Bend, 4” Carlon #UA9AN or equal (Inventory #285-019-00005) $7.20 $1,872.00 $7.90 $2,054.00 $7.68 $1,996.80 $7.19 $1,869.40 $6.54 $1,700.40 $5.71 $1,484.60
6 260 ea 285-019-00006 PVC, Sch 40, Coupling, 1” Carlon #E940F or equal (Inventory #285-019-00006) $0.14 $36.40 $0.14 $35.10 $0.22 $57.20 $0.20 $52.00 $0.25 $65.00 $0.12 $31.20
7 4000 ea 285-019-00007 PVC, Sch 40, Coupling, 2”, Long type Carlon #E941J or equal (Inventory #285-019-00007) $0.80 $3,200.00 $2.36 $9,440.00 $1.40 $5,600.00 $1.25 $5,000.00 $4.97 $19,880.00 $2.32 $9,280.00
8 500 ea 285-019-00008 PVC, Sch 40, Coupling, 4”, Long type Carlon #E941N or equal (Inventory #285-019-00008) $2.90 $1,450.00 $9.65 $4,825.00 $5.31 $2,655.00 $6.75 $3,375.00 $6.72 $3,360.00 $7.94 $3,970.00
9 20 ea 285-019-00014 PVC, Sch 40, 22 1/2 Degree, Bend, 4”  16” radius  Bend Raco #9816-3 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00 $12.40 $248.00 $10.22 $204.40 $6.18 $123.60 $6.56 $131.20 $12.64 $252.80 $8.35 $167.00

10 20 ea 285-019-00015 PVC, Sch 40, Coupling, 6” Carlon #E940R or equal (Inventory #285-019-00015) $4.88 $97.60 $4.75 $95.00 $5.67 $113.40 $5.31 $106.20 $5.03 $100.60 $4.38 $87.60
11 40 ea 285-019-00016 PVC, Sch 40, Elbow, 90 Degree Bend, 6” Carlon #UC9FRB or equal (Inventory #285-019-00016) $38.95 $1,558.00 $126.30 $5,052.00 $21.15 $846.00 $48.25 $1,930.00 $9.51 $380.40 $17.01 $680.40
12 200 ea 285-019-00018 PVC, Sch 40, Coupling, 3” Carlon #E941L or equal (Inventory #285-019-00018) $1.60 $320.00 $7.18 $1,436.00 $3.37 $674.00 $1.12 $224.00 $5.72 $1,144.00 $0.88 $176.00
13 100 ea 285-019-00019 PVC, Sch 40, Elbow, 90 Degree Bend, 3” Carlon #UC9DLB or equal (Inventory #285-019-00019) $9.05 $905.00 $28.00 $2,800.00 $8.19 $819.00 $9.89 $989.00 $10.51 $1,051.00 $3.33 $333.00
14 100 ea 285-019-00020 PVC, Sch 40, Elbow, 45 Degree Bend, 3” Carlon #UA7CLB or equal (Inventory #285-019-00020) $7.95 $795.00 $14.75 $1,475.00 $7.32 $732.00 $5.31 $531.00 $13.63 $1,363.00 $3.17 $317.00
15 40 ea 285-019-00021 PVC, Sch 40, Elbow, 22 1/2 Degree Bend, 3” Carlon #UC5CLB or equal (Inventory #285-019-00021) $7.98 $319.20 $8.90 $356.00 $6.51 $260.40 $10.63 $425.20 $7.51 $300.40 $5.33 $213.20

16 50 ea 285-019-00027
Elbow, Schedule 40, 36” Special Radius Non Metallic, 6” Dia, 22 1/2 Degree Carlon #UA5FR or equal 
(Inventory #285-019-00027) $14.50 $725.00 $26.34 $1,317.00 $22.18 $1,109.00 $36.25 $1,812.50 $19.91 $995.50 $25.98 $1,299.00

17 30 ea 285-019-00028
Elbow, Schedule 40, 36” Special Radius Non Metallic, 6” Dia, 45 Degree Carlon #UA7FR or 
equal(Inventory #285-019-00028) $23.45 $703.50 $44.20 $1,326.00 $20.49 $614.70 $36.25 $1,087.50 $34.17 $1,025.10 $24.50 $735.00

18 400 ea 285-019-00029 Plugs w/Pull Tabs, 2”  Carlon #P258JT or equal (Inventory #285-019-00029) $0.80 $320.00 $0.52 $208.00 $1.04 $416.00 $0.52 $208.00 $0.91 $364.00 $0.49 $196.00
19 100 ea 285-019-00030 Plugs w/Pull Tabs, 3” Carlon #P258LT or equal (Inventory #285-019-00030) $0.92 $92.00 $0.69 $69.00 $1.15 $115.00 $0.67 $67.00 $1.050 $105.00 $0.660 $66.00
20 200 ea 285-019-00031 Plugs w/Pull Tabs, 4” Carlon #P258NT or equal (Inventory #285-019-00031) $0.99 $198.00 $1.19 $238.00 $1.33 $266.00 $0.78 $156.00 $1.12 $224.00 $1.12 $224.00
21 200 ea 285-019-00032 Plugs w/Pull Tabs, 6” Carlon #P258RT or equal (Inventory #285-019-00032) $1.54 $308.00 $2.34 $468.00 $1.90 $380.00 $1.19 $238.00 $1.79 $358.00 $1.85 $370.00
22 200 ea 285-019-00033 Sch 40 & 80, Non-metallic,End Caps, 2” Carlon #E958J or equal (Inventory #285-019-00033) $1.51 $302.00 $2.05 $410.00 $1.84 $368.00 $2.19 $438.00 $1.74 $348.00 $1.67 $334.00
23 100 ea 285-019-00034 Sch 40 & 80, Non-metallic,End Caps, 3” Carlon #E958L or equal (Inventory #285-019-00034) $3.44 $344.00 $4.69 $469.00 $5.75 $575.00 $5.56 $556.00 $3.91 $391.00 $3.80 $380.00
24 200 ea 285-019-00035 Sch 40 & 80, Non-metallic,End Caps, 4” Carlon #E958N or equal (Inventory #285-019-00035) $7.20 $1,440.00 $9.76 $1,952.00 $8.33 $1,666.00 $10.63 $2,126.00 $7.97 $1,594.00 $7.93 $1,586.00
25 100 ea 285-019-00036 Sch 40 & 80, Non-metallic,End Caps, 6” Carlon #E958R or equal (Inventory #285-019-00036) $10.90 $1,090.00 $20.30 $2,030.00 $10.74 $1,074.00 $18.75 $1,875.00 $12.91 $1,291.00 $12.60 $1,260.00
26 300 ea 285-019-00037 Locknut, Male Adapter, 1” E-Line #LN100 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00037) $0.120 $36.00 $0.13 $38.40 No Bid No Bid $0.41 $123.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 300 ea 285-019-00038 Bushing, Plastic, 1” E-Line #PB100 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00038) $0.12 $34.50 No Bid No Bid $1.27 $381.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
28 300 ea 285-019-00039 PVC, Adapter, Male, 1” Carlon #PVF-MA100 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00039) $1.15 $345.00 $0.21 $63.00 $0.31 $93.00 $0.25 $75.00 $0.25 $75.00 $0.19 $57.00
29 300 ea 285-019-00040 Locknut, Male Adapter, 2” E-Line #LN200 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00040) $0.350 $105.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.14 $342.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30 300 ea 285-019-00041 Bushing, Plastic, 2” E-Line #PB200 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00041) $0.320 $96.00 No Bid No Bid $2.68 $804.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
31 300 ea 285-019-00042 PVC, Male Adapter, 2” Carlon #PVF-MA200 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00042) $0.48 $144.00 $0.47 $141.00 $0.67 $201.00 $0.40 $120.00 $0.49 $147.00 $0.43 $129.00
32 200 ea 285-019-00043 Locknut, Male Adapter, 4” E-Line #LN400 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00043) $1.79 $358.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.55 $1,510.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
33 200 ea 285-019-00044 Bushing, Plastic, 4” E-Line #PB400 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00044) $0.90 $180.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
34 200 ea 285-019-00045 PVC, Male Adapter, 4” Carlon #PVF-MA400 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00045) $2.00 $400.00 $2.00 $400.00 $1.87 $374.00 $2.06 $412.00 $2.07 $414.00 $1.85 $370.00
35 30 ea 285-019-00046 PVC, Male Adapter, 6” Carlon #PVF-MA600 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00046) $4.70 $141.00 $4.75 $142.50 $5.46 $163.80 $5.31 $159.30 $4.93 $147.90 $4.82 $144.60

$23,029.80 $46,161.30 $29,937.40 $31,132.30 $43,644.40 $25,637.60
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Group II: PVC Pipe-Rigid & Flexible Conduit

Item No.
Annual Est. 

Qty. UOM Inventory # Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
1 10,000.00 ft 285-019-00009 PVC, Sch 40, Pipe, 1”, 10 ft/section Carlon #49008 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00009) 0.275$       $2,750.00 0.238$       $2,380.00 0.233$       $2,330.00 0.25$         $2,500.00 0.285$       $2,850.00 No Bid No Bid
2 100,000.00 ft 285-019-00010 PVC, Sch 40, Pipe, 2”, 10 ft/section Carlon #49011 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00010) 0.516$       $51,600.00 0.404$       $40,400.00 0.480$       $48,000.00 0.48$         $48,000.00 0.51$         $51,000.00 No Bid No Bid
3 20,000.00 ft 285-019-00011 PVC, Sch 40, Pipe, 4”, 10 ft/section Carlon #49015 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00011) 1.41$         $28,200.00 1.29$         $25,800.00 1.326$       $26,520.00 1.34$         $26,800.00 1.43$         $28,600.00 No Bid No Bid
4 15,000.00 ft 285-019-00012 PVC, Sch 40, Pipe, Gray, 6”, 10 ft/sect Carlon #49017 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00012) 2.76$         $41,400.00 2.57$         $38,550.00 2.799$       $41,985.00 2.50$         $37,500.00 2.81$         $42,150.00 No Bid No Bid

Sub Total $123,950.00 $107,130.00 $118,835.00 $114,800.00 $124,600.00 Incomplete

5 6,000.00 ft 285-019-00013
PVC, Sch 80, Roll Conduit Pipe, 4”, Grey or Black w/red stripe, w/ pull tape Petroflex #P400-SCH80 or 
equal (Inventory #285-019-00013) 2.88$         $17,280.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.35$         $20,100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 5,000.00 ft 285-019-00017 PVC, Sch 40, Pipe, 3”, 10 ft/section Carlon #59613 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00017) 1.08$         $5,400.00 No Bid No Bid 0.950$       $4,750.00 0.99$         $4,950.00 1.07$         $5,350.00 No Bid No Bid

7 10,000.00 ft 285-019-00047
PVC, Sch 40, Roll Conduit Pipe, 1” Grey w/ pull tape Petroflex P100-SCH40 or equal (Inventory #285-
019-00047) 0.46$         $4,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.48$         $4,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 15,000.00 ft 285-019-00048
PVC, Sch 40, Roll Conduit Pipe, 2” Grey w/ pull tape Petroflex P200-SCH40 or equal (Inventory #285-
019-00048) 0.80$         $12,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.90$         $13,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 1,000.00 ft 285-019-00049
PVC, Sch 80, Roll Conduit Pipe, 6” Grey w/ pull tape Petroflex P600-SCH80 or equal (Inventory #285-
019-00049) 6.58$         $6,580.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.59$         $7,590.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sub Total $45,860.00 Incomplete Incomplete $50,940.00 Incomplete Incomplete

Group III:  Intermediate Metal Conduit    KBS Elect. Dist.  TEC Utility Supply   The Home Center       Hughes Supply      FAPCo, LLC

Item No.
Annual Est. 
Qty. UOM Inventory # Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 1,000 ft 285-019-00022
Conduit, Intermediate Metal, 1”, 10 ft/sect., ANSI #C80.6, UL Std.1242 LTV or equal (Inventory #285-
019-00022) No Bid No Bid $1.590 $1,590.00 No Bid No Bid 1.85$         $1,850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 3,000 ft 285-019-00023
Conduit, Intermediate Metal, 2”, 10 ft/sect., ANSI #C80.6, UL Std.1242 LTV or equal (Inventory #285-
019-00023) No Bid No Bid $3.10 $9,300.00 No Bid No Bid 3.62$         $10,860.00 $3.51 $10,530.00 No Bid No Bid

3 200 ft 285-019-00024
Conduit, Intermediate Metal, 3”, 10 ft/sect., ANSI #C80.6, UL Std.1242 LTV or equal (Inventory #285-
019-00024) No Bid No Bid $8.490 $1,698.00 No Bid No Bid 9.91$         $1,982.00 $12.64 $2,528.00 No Bid No Bid

4 500 ft 285-019-00025
Conduit, Intermediate Metal, 4”, 10 ft/sect., ANSI #C80.6, UL Std.1242 LTV or equal (Inventory #285-
019-00025 No Bid No Bid $11.35 $5,675.00 No Bid No Bid 13.20$       $6,600.00 $15.11 $7,555.00 No Bid No Bid

5 200 ft 285-019-00026
Conduit, Rigid Aluminum, 6”, 10 ft/sect., ANSI #C80.6, UL Std.1242 GRC #AL600 or equal (Inventory 
#285-019-00026) No Bid No Bid $14.32 $2,864.00 No Bid No Bid 42.27$       $8,454.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Group III Total Incomplete $21,127.00 Incomplete $29,746.00 Incomplete Incomplete

Certification Y Y Y Y Y Y
Acknowledged Addendum Y Y Y Y Y Y
Exceptions Y* Y* Y* N N Y**
* Prices firm only for 90 days after award of bid.
* *Quoted Kraloy as Manufacturer

Staff Award Recommendation

FAPCo, LLCThe Home Center

Techline

KBS Elect. Dist. Hughes SupplyTechlineTEC Utility Supply 


