ROBOTICS CAMERA SYSTEM & BROADCAST SWITCHER SYSTEM
BID TABULATION #04-58

PUBLIC RELATIONS/MARKETING

Texas Media Systems Frezzolini Broadcast Pix
Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item
Item| Qty Unit Description Price Total Price Total Price Total
1 1 each |Robotics Camera System 49,473.16| $ 49,473.16 66,400.00| $ 66,400.00 no bid
2 1 lot |Installation & Integration of Camera System 5484.12| $ 5,484.12 6,250.00] $ 6,250.00 no bid
3 1 each |Broadcast Switcher System 23,815.28| $ 23,815.28 no bid 29,700.00| $ 29,700.00
4 4 years |Service Agreement 250.00] $ 1,000.00 6,673.75| $ 6,673.75 no bid
5 3 years |Service Agreement 250.00( $ 750.00 6,865.00| $ 6,865.00 no bid
6 2 years |Service Agreement 250.00] $  500.00 6,975.00] $ 6,975.00 no bid
7 1 year |[Service Agreement 250.00 $  250.00 7,795.00[ $ 7,795.00 no bid

NOTE: City shall select between a one, two, three, or four year service agreement

Texas Media Systems Service Agreement does not cover per incident programming, $125.00/hour
Equipment needing repair and returned to the manufacturer will cost the City $25.00 shipping and cost

of repair to be borne by City




