ANNUAL PRICE AGREEMENT FOR TEMPORARY EMPLOYMENT SERVICES
BID TABULATION #04-27
JOINT BID WITH THE CITY OF BRYAN

Willstaff Worldwide Express Personnel Human Resource Connection *Manpower of Texas Labor Ready Kelley Services
Wayne Williamson Al Rampmeier Bonnie Boatwright Bill Floyd John Jean Lawanna Gustavus
318.324.8060 979.776.4455 979.695.8278 979.846.3535 979.260.1662 979.846.5469

ltem | Total Est. Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item

No. Hours Description Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
1 1000 Receptionist 8.89 8,890.00 10.29/ 10,290.00 9.03 9,030.00 10.60 10,600.00 No Bid No Bid 10.36f 10,360.00
2 2500  |Secretary 10.16 25,400.00 11.76| 29,400.00 9.73 24,325.00 10.27 25,675.00 No Bid No Bid 11.05[ 27,625.00
3 100 Administrative Assistant 11.44 1,144.00 13.23| 1,323.00 10.42 1,042.00 10.60 1,060.00 No Bid No Bid 11.74 1,174.00
4 500 Data Entry Clerk 8.90 4,450.00 11.03| 5,515.00 9.73 4,865.00 10.27 5,135.00 No Bid No Bid 10.36 5,180.00
5 1000  [Accounting Clerk 10.81 10,810.00 11.76/ 11,760.00 9.73 9,730.00 11.26 11,260.00 No Bid No Bid 11.05[ 11,050.00
SUBTOTAL - CLERICAL 50,694.00 58,288.00 48,992.00 53,730.00 0.00 55,389.00
6 500 Groundsworker 9.52 4,760.00 10.69] 5,345.00 No Bid No Bid 10.11 5,055.00 9.90 4,950.00 10.06 5,030.00
7 1000 Meter Reader 10.98 10,980.00 12.63| 12,630.00 No Bid No Bid 10.93 10,930.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 500 Heavy Equipment Operator 13.90 6,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.20 6,600.00 No Bid No Bid
9 250 Recycling Center Assistant 9.53 2,382.50 12.20/ 3,050.00 No Bid No Bid 9.56 2,390.00 9.90 2,475.00 10.06 2,515.00
10 750 Water Plant/Field Operator 13.43 10,072.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 100 Service Worker 9.53 953.00 10.78| 1,078.00 No Bid No Bid 9.56 956.00 9.90 990.00 9.34 934.00
12 100 Brush & Bulky Equipment Operator 12.26 1,226.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.60 1,460.00 No Bid No Bid
13 100 Solid Waste Equipment Operator 12.51 1,251.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.20 1,320.00 No Bid No Bid
14 100 Transportation Equipment Operator 13.80 1,380.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.90 1,490.00 No Bid No Bid
SUBTOTAL - SERVICE 39,955.00 22,103.00 0.00 19,331.00 19,285.00 8,479.00

Grand Total Bid $ $ 90,649.00 - - - - -
Waive Fees/Waiting Period for Temp to Perm No No Yes Yes Yes No

Currently Conducting Drug Testing Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Currently Conducting Background Checks Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Prompt Payment Discount $ None None 1% None None None

P-Card Program Yes (no discount) No No No No **Yes

* |t is mutually agreed that if, at any time during the term of this Agreement Manpower is required to increase such wage and/or payroll burden costs as the direct result of any determination,
order or action by any applicable Federal, State or local governmental authority, or third pary insurer, Customer shall reimburse Manpower at cost for any such increase.
** This program is available at an additional cost and would require approval.
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