
City of College Station
Bid Tabulation

BID FOR: Annual Various Electrical Items
DEPARTMENT: Public Utilities/Electrical Div.
BID: 04-52

P.O.:
KBS Electrical Supply Utiliserve (Hughes) Priester Mell & Nich. Priester Supply 
Bryan, TX Kerrville, TX Austin, TX Austin, TX
Contact: Marvin O. Contact: Jason L. Contact: Ross N. Contact: Teddy M.

Item Unit Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item
No. Quan. Meas. Description Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

Group A: Crossarm Braces
1 100 ea Brace, Deadend, 8', Fiberglass 0.00 150.00 15,000.00 0.00 167.4000 16,740.00
2 200 ea Brace, Crossarm , 8', Fiberglass, Std Duty 0.00 74.00 14,800.00 0.00 76.5000 15,300.00
3 75 ea Brace, Crossarm, 10', Fiberglass, Std Dty 0.00 88.24 6,618.00 0.00 87.9900 6,599.25
4 10 ea Brace, Deadend, 10', Fiberglass, Hvy Dty 0.00 184.45 1,844.50 0.00 186.9000 1,869.00

Group A Total $: No Bid 38,262.50 No Bid 40,508.25

Group B: Lamps & Light Fixtures
1 500 ea Light Bulb, Hi Press, Sodium, 100 W 8.40 4,200.00 7.85 3,925.00 0.00 7.59 3,795.00
2 200 ea Light Bulb, Hi Press, Sodium, 200 W 8.40 1,680.00 9.81 1,962.00 0.00 10.24 2,048.00
3 400 ea Light Bulb, Hi Press, Sodium, 400 W 8.40 3,360.00 9.00 3,600.00 0.00 8.65 3,460.00
4 50 ea Light Fixture, HP, Sodium, Cobrahead,100 W,Gry 64.35 3,217.50 No Bid 0.00 70.50 3,525.00
5 50 ea Light Fixture, HP, Sodium, Cobrahead,100 W,Brz 64.35 3,217.50 No Bid 0.00 70.50 3,525.00
6 100 ea Light Fixture, HP, Sodium, Cobrahead,200 W,Brz 71.60 7,160.00 No Bid 0.00 75.00 7,500.00
7 100 ea Light Fixture, HP, Sodium, Cobrahead,400 W,Brz 98.60 9,860.00 No Bid 0.00 101.00 10,100.00
8 50 ea Light Fixture, Floodmaster, 400 W,Brz 132.60 6,630.00 No Bid 0.00 133.00 6,650.00
9 25 ea Light Fixture, Floodmaster, 100 W,Brz 121.00 3,025.00 No Bid 0.00 125.00 3,125.00

Group B Total $: 42,350.00 9,487.00 No Bid 43,728.00

Group C: Meter Sockets
1 150 ea Socket, Meter, Overhead, 200 amp, 4 term. 20.90 3,135.00 21.40 3,210.00 20.45 3,067.50 20.83 3,124.50
2 700 ea Socket, Meter, Undergrnd, 200 amp, 4 term., resid. 31.00 21,700.00 31.20 21,840.00 31.00 21,700.00 29.49 20,643.00
3 30 ea Socket, Meter, URD or O/H, 320 amp, 4 term. 129.50 3,885.00 134.09 4,022.70 129.00 3,870.00 129.00 3,870.00
4 40 ea Socket, Meter, 200 amp, URD, 7 Term. 81.00 3,240.00 82.25 3,290.00 79.00 3,160.00 79.99 3,199.60
5 75 ea Socket Bases, 13 Term. For CL20, 3PH, w/switch 144.90 10,867.50 148.47 11,135.25 141.00 10,575.00 144.89 10,866.75
6 150 ea Socket Bases, Duplex Type, 200 amp, URD 100.60 15,090.00 103.12 15,468.00 98.00 14,700.00 98.90 14,835.00

Group C Total $: 57,917.50 58,965.95 57,072.50 56,538.85

Grand Total Bid $ 100,267.50$          106,715.45$          57,072.50$         140,775.10$          

Award recommendation by Vendor $: 33,110.00$            16,802.50$         31,037.30$            
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City of College Station
Bid Tabulation

P.O.:
Techline, Inc. Dealers Electrical Fastenal Wesco
Austin, TX Bryan, TX Bryan, TX San Antonio, TX
Contact: Kelly McGill Contact: Joe Conaway Contact: Mike Wollard Contact: Mark D.

Item Unit Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item
No. Quan. Meas. Description Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

Group A: Crossarm Braces
1 100 ea Brace, Deadend, 8', Fiberglass 150.00 15,000.00 0.0000 0.00 0.00 192.0000 19,200.00
2 200 ea Brace, Crossarm, 8', Fiberglass, Std Duty 75.00 15,000.00 0.0000 0.00 0.00 95.0000 19,000.00
3 75 ea Brace, Crossarm, 10', Fiberglass, Std Dty 92.00 6,900.00 0.0000 0.00 0.00 110.0000 8,250.00
4 10 ea Brace, Deadend, 10', Fiberglass, Hvy Dty 180.00 1,800.00 0.0000 0.00 0.00 240.0000 2,400.00

Group A Total $: 38,700.00 0.00 No Bid 48,850.00

Group B: Lamps & Light Fixtures
1 500 ea Light Bulb, Hi Press, Sodium, 100 W 8.27 4,135.00 7.79 3,895.00 12.20 6,100.00 8.75 4,375.00
2 200 ea Light Bulb, Hi Press, Sodium, 200 W 8.77 1,754.00 8.16 1,632.00 13.72 2,744.00 11.50 2,300.00
3 400 ea Light Bulb, Hi Press, Sodium, 400 W 8.60 3,440.00 8.00 3,200.00 10.17 4,068.00 8.75 3,500.00
4 50 ea Light Fixture, HP, Sodium, Cobrahead,100 W,Gry 65.22 3,261.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 72.25 3,612.50
5 50 ea Light Fixture, HP, Sodium, Cobrahead,100 W,Brz 65.22 3,261.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 72.25 3,612.50
6 100 ea Light Fixture, HP, Sodium, Cobrahead,200 W,Brz 72.58 7,258.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 77.50 7,750.00
7 100 ea Light Fixture, HP, Sodium, Cobrahead,400 W,Brz 100.00 10,000.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 103.00 10,300.00
8 50 ea Light Fixture, Floodmaster, 400 W,Brz 134.51 6,725.50 No Bid 0.00 0.00 135.00 6,750.00
9 25 ea Light Fixture, Floodmaster, 100 W,Brz 122.84 3,071.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 130.00 3,250.00

Group B Total $: 42,905.50 8,727.00 12,912.00 45,450.00

Group C: Meter Sockets
1 150 ea Socket, Meter, Overhead, 200 amp, 4 term. 23.02 3,453.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 22.77 3,415.50
2 700 ea Socket, Meter, Undergrnd, 200 amp, 4 term., resid. 34.38 24,066.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 34.03 23,821.00
3 30 ea Socket, Meter, URD or O/H, 320 amp, 4 term. 128.71 3,861.30 0.00 0.00 0.00 127.27 3,818.10
4 40 ea Socket, Meter, 200 amp, URD, 7 Term. 107.00 4,280.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 105.73 4,229.20
5 75 ea Socket Bases, 13 Term. For CL20, 3PH, w/switch 146.00 10,950.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 143.87 10,790.25
6 150 ea Socket Bases, Duplex Type, 200 amp, URD 92.00 13,800.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 90.87 13,630.50

Group C Total $: 60,410.30 0.00 No Bid 59,704.55

Grand Total Bid $ 142,015.80$          8,727.00$             12,912.00$         154,004.55$          

Award recommendation by Vendor $: 4,832.00$             17,448.60$            

 Staff Award Recommendation
                                     Total Award  $134,830.40

***Note: Tie bid awarded to _________ (Group A: Item 1) determined by casting of lots at Council Mtg--
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