
 

KBS Electrical Distributor Priester-Mell & Nich 

Item Est. Unit Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item
No. Quan. Meas. Description City Inventory # Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

Group A--15 kV URD Cable Accessories Low Unit Cost
1 50 EA Deadbreak T-Body Connector 285-022-00031 117.95 5,897.50 116.50 5,825.00 119.15 5,957.50 84.45 4,222.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 84.45
2 50 EA Deadbreak T-Body Connector 285-022-00030 134.40 6,720.00 130.50 6,525.00 119.15 5,957.50 181.35 9,067.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 119.15
3 150 EA Deadbreak T-OPII Connector 285-022-00033 213.00 31,950.00 200.00 30,000.00 213.50 32,025.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 200.00
4 20 EA Deadbreak Junction 285-095-00009 337.00 6,740.00 280.00 5,600.00 340.17 6,803.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 280.00
5 50 EA Protective Cap 285-095-00010 48.25 2,412.50 50.00 2,500.00 48.55 2,427.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54.50 2,725.00 No Bid No Bid 48.25
6 150 EA Protective Cap 285-095-00004 18.10 2,715.00 16.00 2,400.00 16.40 2,460.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 28.50 4,275.00 No Bid No Bid 16.00
7 25 EA Bushing Adaptor 285-095-00011 136.15 3,403.75 136.00 3,400.00 156.68 3,917.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 136.00
8 500 EA Loadbreak Elbow 285-082-00001 20.75 10,375.00 20.25 10,125.00 20.00 10,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 34.00 17,000.00 No Bid No Bid 20.00
9 50 EA Loadbreak Elbow 285-082-00002 20.75 1,037.50 20.90 1,045.00 20.00 1,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 34.00 1,700.00 No Bid No Bid 20.00

10 40 EA Loadbreak Junction 285-095-00003 127.00 5,080.00 115.00 4,600.00 128.50 5,140.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 150.00 6,000.00 No Bid No Bid 115.00
11 20 EA Loadbreak Junction 285-095-00001 98.25 1,965.00 93.00 1,860.00 99.55 1,991.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 125.00 2,500.00 No Bid No Bid 93.00
12 20 EA Loadbreak Junction 285-095-00002 105.25 2,105.00 100.00 2,000.00 106.48 2,129.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 135.00 2,700.00 No Bid No Bid 100.00
13 400 EA Loadbreak Bushing Insert 285-095-00006 20.50 8,200.00 19.50 7,800.00 20.74 8,296.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.00 10,000.00 No Bid No Bid 19.50
14 50 EA Two-Way Bushing Insert 285-095-00007 88.40 4,420.00 100.00 5,000.00 87.98 4,399.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 87.98
15 600 EA Elbow Cable Seal 285-082-00019 6.65 3,990.00 6.30 3,780.00 13.40 8,040.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.30
16 100 EA Elbow Cable Seal 285-082-00020 12.80 1,280.00 8.50 850.00 19.00 1,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.75 1,875.00 No Bid No Bid 8.50
17 150 EA Elbow Arrester 285-082-00005 56.30 8,445.00 56.00 8,400.00 56.40 8,460.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 85.75 12,862.50 No Bid No Bid 56.00
18 100 EA Insulated Standoff Bushing 285-095-00005 30.40 3,040.00 27.00 2,700.00 29.15 2,915.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.00 4,500.00 No Bid No Bid 27.00
19 100 EA Parking Stand Arrester 285-082-00022 165.00 16,500.00 120.00 12,000.00 169.15 16,915.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 120.00
20 24 EA Cable Terminator Cold Shrink Type 285-082-00018 32.78 786.72 44.00 1,056.00 65.00 1,560.00 87.15 2,091.60 No Bid No Bid 35.00 840.00 19.65 471.60 19.65
21 36 EA Cable Terminator, Outdoor, 15 kV, 750 MCM 285-082-00023 167.00 6,012.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.00 1,512.00 172.00 6,192.00 42.00
22 100 EA Cable Terminator, Pole Type, Outdoor, 1/0 285-082-00003 16.65 1,665.00 32.00 3,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.00 3,500.00 No Bid No Bid 16.65
23 25 EA Cable Terminator, Pole Type, Outdoor, 4/0 285-082-00016 16.65 416.25 27.50 687.50 33.50 837.50 52.55 1,313.75 No Bid No Bid 20.00 500.00 14.38 359.50 14.38
24 100 EA Disconnectable Secondary Transf. Conn. 285-008-00008 23.50 2,350.00 35.00 3,500.00 No Bid No Bid 27.33 2,733.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 26.14 2,614.00 23.50
25 200 EA Disconnectable Secondary Transf. Conn. 285-008-00004 19.90 3,980.00 15.90 3,180.00 No Bid No Bid 36.60 7,320.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.00 7,000.00 15.90
26 50 EA Inline Splice, 200 amp, 15 kV, 95 kV BIL 285-076-00002 31.64 1,582.00 17.30 865.00 29.33 1,466.50 33.35 1,667.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 17.30
27 100 EA Inline Splice, 600 amp, 15 kV, 95 kV BIL 285-076-00004 172.35 17,235.00 197.00 19,700.00 230.00 23,000.00 254.10 25,410.00 No Bid No Bid 225.00 22,500.00 No Bid No Bid 172.35
28 25 EA Inline Splice, 200 amp, 15 kV, 95 kV Bil 285-076-00003 35.60 890.00 22.00 550.00 33.00 825.00 36.40 910.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 22.00
29 150 EA Underground Faulted Circuit Indicator, 1 PH 285-111-00001 138.00 20,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 116.70 17,505.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 116.70
30 150 EA Underground Faulted Circuit Indicator, 1 PH 285-111-00002 No Bid No Bid 115.00 17,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 115.00
31 150 EA Underground Faulted Circuit Indicator, 1 PH 285-111-00003 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
32 200 EA Disconnectable Secondary Transf. Conn. 285-008-00007 14.15 2,830.00 11.00 2,200.00 13.60 2,720.00 14.56 2,912.00 13.08 2,616.00 No Bid No Bid 13.92 2,784.00 11.00
33 200 EA Insulated Secondary Connector, 6 hole 285-008-00012 8.25 1,650.00 7.90 1,580.00 8.25 1,650.00 8.90 1,780.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.42 1,684.00 7.90
34 100 EA Secondary Connector, 6 hole, 350 MCM 285-008-00014 5.65 565.00 4.70 470.00 5.75 575.00 6.25 625.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.88 588.00 4.70
35 50 EA Splice Re-jacketing Kit, Cold Shrink Type 285-076-00005 34.80 1,740.00 32.00 1,600.00 31.30 1,565.00 34.80 1,740.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 31.30

Group B--Padmount Enclosures Boxes
1 30 EA Padmounted Enclosure, 200 amp 285-045-00005 728.00 21,840.00 1100.00 33,000.00 390.42 11,712.60 337.00 10,110.00 743.00 22,290.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 337.00
2 10 EA Padmounted Enclosure, 600 amp 285-045-00006 1020.00 10,200.00 1750.00 17,500.00 564.90 5,649.00 380.00 3,800.00 1198.00 11,980.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 380.00
3 50 EA Padmounted Enclosure, w/200 amp, 4-way 285-045-00004 359.00 17,950.00 790.00 39,500.00 236.70 11,835.00 200.00 10,000.00 344.00 17,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 200.00
4 15 EA Pull Box, 36"X60"X48" 285-045-00007 853.00 12,795.00 790.00 11,850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 817.00 12,255.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 790.00
5 15 EA Pull Box, 48"X96"X48" 285-045-00008 1836.00 27,540.00 1950.00 29,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2012.00 30,180.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1836.00
6 50 EA Secondary Pedestal 285-045-00009 128.00 6,400.00 75.40 3,770.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 76.43 3,821.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 75.40

Group C--Padmounted Switchgear
1 2 EA Padmounted Switchgear, 600 amp 285-109-00003 19035.27 38,070.54 19781.72 39,563.44 20241.00 40,482.00 45758.00 91,516.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 19035.27
2 2 EA Padmounted Switchgear, 600 amp, 3 phase 285-109-00004 15600.37 31,200.74 17467.51 34,935.02 17289.00 34,578.00 42421.00 84,842.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15600.37
3 2 EA Padmounted Switchgear, (2) 600 amp, 3 ph 285-109-00005 18807.42 37,614.84 20715.30 41,430.60 20500.00 41,000.00 44530.50 89,061.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18807.42

Total Award Recommendation to Vendor $

Ryan Gold
512.452.7634877.270.3390

Wesco
Mark Davis
210.225.0492817.640.6363

TEC Supply & Service
Adrian Lopez

512.868.8610 x 309979.822.1093

Techline, Inc.
Kelly McGill
512.615.8127
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