ANNUAL PRICE AGREEMENT AND SPECIFICATIONS FOR PVC PIPE & FITTINGS
BID TABULATION #04-17

ELECTRICAL
KBS Electric Dist. TEC Utility Supply & Service |Ward Electric Supply Techline Hughes Supply
Bryan, TX Georgetown, TX Conroe, TX Austin, TX Kerrville, TX
L Tom Bovd Cathv Sams Kellv McGill Jason Leake
Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
Group |: PVC Fittings Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Annual Est.
Item No.|Qty. UOM |Description
1 160] ea |PVC, Sch 40, 90 Degree, Bend, 1" Carlon #UA9CF or equal (Inventory #285-019-00001) $2.55 $408.00 3.23 $516.80 $3.17 $507.20 $2.84 $454.40 $4.08 $652.80
2 320] ea |PVC, Sch 40, 45 Degree, Bend, 2" Carlon #UA7CJ or equal (Inventory #285-019-00002) $2.28] $729.60) $ 3.35 $1,072.00 $3.31] $1,059.20 $2.69| $860.80 $3.64]  $1,164.80)
3 1000 ea |PVC, Sch 40, 90 Degree, Bend, 2" Carlon #UA9CJ or equal (Inventory #285-019-00003) $3.10) $3,100.00) $ 4.55 $4,550.00 $4.49 $4,490.00) $3.33 $3,330.00 $4.92|  $4,920.00)
4 50| ea |PVC, Sch 40, 45 Degree, Bend, 4’ Picoma #MUA7AN or equal (Inventory #285-019-00004) $5.70 $285.00f $ 5.75 $287.50 $5.65 $282.50 $6.00 $300.00 $6.34 $317.00
5 260] ea |PVC, Sch 40, 90 Degree, Bend, 4" Carlon #UA9AN or equal (Inventory #285-019-00005) $5.92] $1,539.20) $ 5.95 $1,547.00) $5.88 $1,528.80 $6.22] $1,617.20] $6.14]  $1,596.40)
6| 260 ea |PVC, Sch 40, Coupling, 1" Carlon #E940F or equal (Inventory #285-019-00006) $0.16 $41.60) $ 0.13 $33.80] $0.13 $33.80] $0.14 $36.40) $0.14 $36.40)
7 4000] ea |PVC, Sch 40, Coupling, 2”, Long type Carlon #£941J or equal (Inventory #285-019-00007) $0.80] $3,200.00) $ 1.13 $4,520.00 $1.11 $4,440.00 $0.63 $2,520.00) $3.94] $15,760.00)
8 500] ea |PVC, Sch 40, Coupling, 4", Long type Carlon #E941N or equal (Inventory #285-019-00008) $2.70) $1,350.00f $ 4.00 $2,000.00 $3.79 $1,895.00) $3.21 $1,605.00 $6.58]  $3,290.00)
9 20| ea |[PVC, Sch 40, 22 1/2 Degree, Bend, 4" 16" radius Bend Raco #9816-3 or equal (Inventory #285-019 $6.20 $124.00) $ 8.00 $160.00 $7.85 $157.00 $6.40 $128.00 $9.60 $192.00
10) 20| ea |PVC, Sch 40, Coupling, 6” Carlon #E940R or equal (Inventory #285-019-00015) $4.58] $91.60) $ 4.55 $91.00) $4.50] $90.00| $4.74] $94.80| $4.99 $99.80)
11] 40| ea |PVC, Sch 40, Elbow, 90 Degree Bend, 6" Carlon #UC9FRB or equal (Inventory #285-019-00016) $37.00) $1,480.00) $ 60.00 $2,400.00 $59.99| $2,399.60) $39.67| $1,586.80 $18.42 $736.80
12 200 ea |PVC, Sch 40, Coupling, 3" Carlon #£941L or equal (Inventory #285-019-00018) $1.55 $310.00§ $ 0.92 $184.00 $0.91 $182.00 $1.60 $320.00 $5.52|  $1,104.00
13| 100] ea |PVC, Sch 40, Elbow, 90 Degree Bend, 3" Carlon #UC9DLB or equal (Inventory #285-019-00019) $8.45] $845.00) $ 3.50 $350.00 $3.42] $342.00 $8.86 $886.00 $4.81 $481.00
14] 100] ea |PVC, Sch 40, Elbow, 45 Degree Bend, 3" Carlon #UA7CLB or equal (Inventory #285-019-00020) $7.46 $746.00) $ 3.30 $330.00 $3.26 $326.00 $7.74 $774.00 $3.37 $337.00
15 40| ea [PVC, Sch 40, Elbow, 22 1/2 Degree Bend, 3" Carlon #UC5CLB or equal (Inventory #285-019-00021 $7.60| $304.00) $ 12.50 $500.00] $12.25| $490.00] $8.07 $322.80 $4.50 $180.00
Elbow, Schedule 40, 36" Special Radius Non Metallic, 6" Dia, 22 1/2 Degree Carlon #UA5FR or
equal (Inventory #285-019-00027)
16] 50| ea $13.30} $665.00f $ 14.40 $720.00 $14.20) $710.00 $14.62 $731.00 $22.30]  $1,115.00)
Elbow, Schedule 40, 36" Special Radius Non Metallic, 6" Dia, 45 Degree Carlon #UA7FR or
17| 30| ea [|equal(Inventory #285-019-00028) $22.40) $672.00] $ 20.00 $600.00 $19.73] $591.90 $23.35] $700.50 $36.19]  $1,085.70]
18| 400| ea |Plugs w/Pull Tabs, 2" Carlon #P258JT or equal (Inventory #285-019-00029) $0.74] $296.00) $ 0.35 $140.00 $0.35 $140.00 $0.77| $308.00 $0.87 $348.00
19 100 ea [Plugs w/Pull Tabs, 3" Carlon #P258LT or equal (Inventory #285-019-00030) $0.82 $82.00] $ 0.47 $47.00| $0.48 $48.00| $0.84 $84.00] $0.964] $96.40)
20 200 ea |Plugs w/Pull Tabs, 4" Carlon #P258NT or equal (Inventory #285-019-00031) $0.91 $182.00) $ 0.81 $162.00] $0.81 $162.00] $0.93 $186.00 $1.06| $212.00
21 200] ea |Plugs w/Pull Tabs, 6" Carlon #P258RT or equal (Inventory #285-019-00032) $1.44] $288.00f $ 135 $270.00 $1.32 $264.00 $1.48 $296.00 $1.66 $332.00
22 200 ea |Sch 40 & 80, Non-metallic,End Caps, 2" Carlon #£958J or equal (Inventory #285-019-00033) $1.42 $284.00) $ 1.40 $280.00 $1.38 $276.00 $1.44 $288.00 $1.65 $330.00
23 100] ea |Sch 40 & 80, Non-metallic,End Caps, 3" Carlon #E958L or equal (Inventory #285-019-00034) $3.26] $326.00) $ 3.19 $319.00 $3.12] $312.00 $3.35] $335.00 $4.14] $414.00
24 200] ea |Sch 40 & 80, Non-metallic,End Caps, 4” Carlon #E958N or equal (Inventory #285-019-00035) $6.73] $1,346.00] $ 6.63 $1,326.00 $6.52 $1,304.00) $6.96 $1,392.00 $7.77|  $1,554.00]
25 100] ea |Sch 40 & 80, Non-metallic,End Caps, 6" Carlon #E958R or equal (Inventory #285-019-00036) $10.29) $1,029.00] $ 10.50 $1,050.00 $10.32 $1,032.00) $10.86] $1,086.00 $12.29]  $1,229.00]
26 300] ea |Locknut, Male Adapter, 1" E-Line #LN100 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00037) $0.115] $34.50] $ 0.095 $28.50) $0.12] $36.00] $0.10) $30.00|No Bid
27 300 ea |[Bushing, Plastic, 1" E-Line #PB100 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00038) $0.11 $33.00) $ 0.099 $29.70| $0.09 $27.00| $0.09 $27.00|No Bid
28 300 ea |PVC, Adapter, Male, 1" Carlon #PVF-MA100 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00039) $1.14] $342.00) $ 0.205 $61.50| $0.20 $60.00| $1.10| $330.00 $0.21 $63.00)
29 300 ea [Locknut, Male Adapter, 2" E-Line #LN200 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00040) $0.295] $88.50) $ 0.255 $76.50] $0.33 $99.00| $0.29 $87.00|No Bid
30 300] ea |Bushing, Plastic, 2" E-Line #PB200 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00041) $0.275] $82.50] $ 0.285 $85.50| $0.31 $93.00] $0.27 $81.00|No Bid
31 300] ea |PVC, Male Adapter, 2" Carlon #PVF-MA200 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00042) $0.46] $138.00) $ 0.45 $135.00 $0.45] $135.00 $0.46] $138.00 $0.46] $138.00
32| 200 ea [Locknut, Male Adapter, 4” E-Line #LN400 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00043) $1.59 $318.00f $ 143 $286.00 $1.60 $320.00 $1.54 $308.00[No Bid
33 200| ea |Bushing, Plastic, 4" E-Line #PB400 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00044) $0.82 $164.00f $ 0.77 $154.00 $0.88 $176.00 $0.82 $164.00[No Bid
34 200] ea |PVC, Male Adapter, 4" Carlon #PVF-MA400 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00045) $1.94] $388.00) $ 1.93 $386.00 $1.91] $382.00 $1.99] $398.00 $1.96] $392.00
35 30] ea |PVC, Male Adapter, 6" Carlon #PVF-MAB0O or equal (Inventory #285-019-00046) $4.63 $138.90f $ 4.60 $138.00 $4.51 $135.30 $4.68 $140.40 $4.67 $140.10
Group | Total $21,451. $24,836.80 $24,526.30 $21,946.10 $38,317.20




Group Il: PVC Pipe-Rigid & Flexible Conduit KBS Elect. Dist TEC Utility Supply & Service] Ward Electric Supply Techline Hughes Supply
Annual Est.

Item No. Qty. UOM | Description Unit Price |Total Price Unit Price |Total Price Unit Price |Total Price | Unit Price |Total Price |Unit Price[Total Price
1] 10,000.00] ft [PVC, Sch 40, Pipe, 1", 10 ft/section Carlon #49008 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00009) $ 0.245 | $ 2/450.000 | $ 01741$ 1740000 $ 0.178 | $ 1,780.000 No Bid $ 0.210 | $2,100.000
2| 100,000.00] ft |PVC, Sch 40, Pipe, 2", 10 ft/section Carlon #49011 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00010) $ 0.395 | $39,500.000 | $ 0.345| $ 34500.000 § $  0.352 | $35,200.000 No Bid $  0.30 |
3| 20,000.00] ft |PVC, Sch 40, Pipe, 4", 10 ft/section Carlon #49015 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00011) $ 1.06 | $21,200.000 | $ 1.05|$ 21,000.000 | $ 1.04 | $20,800.000 No Bid $ 104 | bt
4] 15,000.00f ft |PVC, Sch 40, Pipe, Gray, 6", 10 ft/sect Carlon #49017 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00012) $ 1.83 | $27,450.000 | $ 193 [$ 28950.000 § $  1.939 | $29,085.000 No Bid $  1.80 |

PVC, Sch 80, Roll Conduit Pipe, 4", Grey or Black wired stripe, w/ pull tape Petroflex #P400-SCH80
5| 6,000.00] ft |orequal (Inventory #285-019-00013) $ 2.30 | $13,800.000 | $ 215 | $ 12,900.000 | $ 2.23 | $13,380.000 | $ 2.30 | $ 13,800.00 | No Bid
6] 5,000.00] ft |PVC, Sch 40, Pipe, 3", 10 ft/section Carlon #59613 or equal (Inventory #285-019-00017) $ 0.74 | $ 3,700.000 | $ 080)|$ 4000000)$ 0779 $ 3,895.000 No Bid $  0.73 | $3,650.000
PVC, Sch 40, Roll Conduit Pipe, 1" Grey w/ pull tape Petroflex P100-SCH40 or equal (Inventory #284
7] 10,000.00] ft [019-00047) $ 0.38 | $ 3,800.000 | $ 0282|$ 2820000} $ 0.37 | $ 3,700.000 | $ 0.35 | $ 3,500.00 | No Bid
PVC, Sch 40, Roll Conduit Pipe, 2" Grey w/ pull tape Petroflex P200-SCH40 or equal (Inventory #284
8| 15,000.00] ft ]019-00048) $ 0.64 | $ 9,600.000 | $ 051|$ 7650000 | $ 0.63 | $ 9,450.000 | $ 0.61 | $ 9,150.00 | No Bid
PVC, Sch 80, Roll Conduit Pipe, 6" Grey w/ pull tape Petroflex P600-SCH80 or equal (Inventory #284
9] 1,000.00] ft ]019-00049) $ 5.50 | $ 5500.000 | $ 330|$ 3300000 | $ 594 | $ 5940.000 | $ 491 | $ 4,910.00 | No Bid
Group Il Total TR $ 116,860.000 T $31,360.00 R
Group llIl: Intermediate Metal Conduit KBS Elect. Dist TEC Utility Supply & Service | Ward Electric Supply Techline Hughes Supply
Annual Est.
Item No.|Qty. UOM | Description Unit Price | Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price| Total Price
Conduit, Intermediate Metal, 1", 10 ft/sect., ANSI #C80.6, UL Std.1242 LTV or equal (Inventory #285-|
1] 1,000 ft |019-00022) $0.78 $780.00f $ 0791 % 790.00 $0.767| $767.00] No Bid No Bid
Conduit, Intermediate Metal, 2", 10 ft/sect., ANSI #C80.6, UL Std.1242 LTV or equal (Inventory #285-|
2| 3,000, ft |019-00023) $1.52 $4,560.00f $ 160|$  4,800.00 $1.55 $4,650.00] No Bid $1.41  $4,230.00)
Conduit, Intermediate Metal, 3", 10 ft/sect., ANSI #C80.6, UL Std.1242 LTV or equal (Inventory #285-|
3 200] ft ]019-00024) $4.15 $830.00f $ 4351 $ 870.00 $4.235) $847.00| No Bid $3.94] $788.00
Conduit, Intermediate Metal, 4", 10 ft/sect., ANSI #C80.6, UL Std.1242 LTV or equal (Inventory #285-|
4 500 ft |019-00025 $5.58 $2,790.00f $ 589 [$ 294500 $5.69 $2,845.00 No Bid $4.84]  $2,420.00
Conduit, Rigid Aluminum, 6", 10 ft/sect., ANSI #C80.6, UL Std.1242 GRC #AL600 or equal
5] 200 ft [(Inventory #285-019-00026) No Bid $ 1205($ 241000 $11.65] $2,330.00f No Bid No Bid
Group Il Total $8,960.00 $ 11,815.00 $11,439. $ - $7,438.00

Staff Award Recommendatior:




