
City of College Station
Bid Tabulation

ANNUAL BID FOR VARIOUS AUTOMOTIVE & TRUCK PARTS
DEPARTMENT: Public Works / Fleet Division
BID:  #04-05

NAPA Auto Parts Autozone O'Reilly Auto Parts Performance Truck Truckmotive, Inc
College Station, TX Bryan, TX College Station, TX Bryan, TX Waco, TX
Tom Parlow Matt Morales Doug Bennett Austin Pell Nathan Holecek

Item Sample Unit Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item
No. Quan. Meas. Description Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

Category A--Automotive Parts
I-1 10 sets Spark plug wire sets--'00 Ford Crown Vic 24.64 246.40 53.73 537.30 57.42 574.20 No Bid No Bid
2 40 sets Spark plug sets--'00 Ford Crown Vic 14.16 566.40 29.99 1,199.60 21.52 860.80 No Bid No Bid
3 10 ea Starter for 1998 Chev. V-6 Pickup 88.16 881.60 89.55 895.50 70.13 701.30 No Bid No Bid
4 10 ea Alternator for '98 Chev. 350 Pickup 89.59 895.90 99.50 995.00 124.05 1,240.50 No Bid No Bid
5 3 ea Starter for '00 Ford Crown Vic 141.17 423.51 112.43 337.29 138.53 415.59 No Bid No Bid

II-1 10 ea Fan belt for '00 Ford Super Duty 27.44 274.40 38.80 388.00 18.56 185.60 No Bid No Bid
2 10 ea New water pump '00 Ford Vic 39.99 399.90 40.79 407.90 36.72 367.20 No Bid No Bid
3 10 ea Fan belt for '00 Ford Vic 25.99 259.90 17.91 179.10 21.28 212.80 No Bid No Bid
4 5 ea New water pump for '00 Ford Super Duty 239.00 1,195.00 298.50 1,492.50 203.24 1,016.20 No Bid No Bid

III-1 250 ea Oil filter--Baldwin B329 2.84 710.00 2.00 500.00 2.70 675.00 2.77 692.50 2.67 667.50
2 150 ea Oil filter--Baldwin B7039 7.41 1,111.50 7.98 1,197.00 6.89 1,033.50 6.86 1,029.00 6.46 969.00
3 50 ea Transmission filter--Baldwin 18029 14.41 720.50 12.98 649.00 9.41 470.50 10.29 514.50 9.60 480.00
4 175 ea Air filter--Baldwin PA2152 3.76 658.00 3.98 696.50 3.32 581.00 3.80 665.00 3.65 638.75
5 50 ea Fuel filter--Baldwin BF7668 5.40 270.00 5.98 299.00 4.77 238.50 4.11 205.50 4.14 207.00
6 100 ea Air filter--Baldwin PA4120 8.03 803.00 11.98 1,198.00 7.09 709.00 7.22 722.00 6.72 672.00

IV-1 100 ea Light bulb--G.E. 1157 0.25 25.00 3.49 349.00 0.19 19.00 0.26 26.00 No Bid
2 100 ea Light bulb--G.E. 1156 0.59 59.00 3.49 349.00 0.38 38.00 0.54 54.00 No Bid
3 16 ea Sealed halogen beam--#H6054 8.84 141.44 8.98 143.68 6.83 109.28 5.89 94.24 No Bid
4 10 ea Sealed beam, low--#4652 4.50 45.00 5.68 56.80 3.12 31.20 3.37 33.70 No Bid
5 10 ea Headlight, high/low--#9004 4.99 49.90 6.98 69.80 3.43 34.30 2.56 25.60 No Bid
6 20 ea Flasher, 2 prong #552 1.10 22.00 1.98 39.60 0.90 18.00 7.13 142.60 No Bid
7 20 ea Flasher, 2 prong #536 1.51 30.20 1.98 39.60 0.90 18.00 7.13 142.60 No Bid
8 20 ea Mini bulb--#1895 0.50 10.00 1.98 39.60 0.22 4.40 0.29 5.80 No Bid

V-1 20 ea Idler arm for '00 ford Crown Vic 33.99 679.80 30.84 616.80 45.63 912.60 No Bid No Bid
2 10 ea Pitman Arm for '00 Ford Super Duty 24.56 245.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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3 10 sets Ball joints, (upper & lower) --'00 Ford Vic 71.75 717.50 57.70 577.00 70.64 706.40 No Bid No Bid
4 20 ea Tie rod ends --'00 Ford Super Duty 21.46 429.20 No Bid 19.25 385.00 No Bid No Bid
5 20 ea Shock absorbers--'00 Ford Vic 23.12 462.40 19.90 398.00 27.56 551.20 No Bid No Bid

VI-1 50 sets Rear brake pads--'00 Ford Crown Vic 36.33 1,816.50 19.90 995.00 35.28 1,764.00 No Bid No Bid
2 30 sets Front metallic pads--'98 Chev Lumina 15.99 479.70 15.92 477.60 29.68 890.40 No Bid No Bid
3 10 ea New master cylinder--'98 Chev Pickup 86.61 866.10 99.99 999.90 51.03 510.30 No Bid No Bid
4 20 sets Front pads--'00 Ford Crown Vic 37.28 745.60 19.90 398.00 34.96 699.20 No Bid No Bid
5 4 ea Front Rotor--'00 Ford Crown Vic 31.99 127.96 39.99 159.96 46.98 187.92 No Bid No Bid

VII-1 5 ea AC compressor--'00 Ford Crown Vic 157.59 787.95 169.98 849.90 179.59 897.95 No Bid No Bid
2 5 ea AC compressor--'00 Ford Super Duty 204.94 1,024.70 No Bid 216.20 1,081.00 No Bid No Bid
3 5 ea AC compressor--'98 Chev Pickup, V-6 199.00 995.00 199.00 995.00 289.16 1,445.80 No Bid No Bid
4 5 ea AC compressor''-98 Chev Lumina 212.00 1,060.00 248.75 1,243.75 242.89 1,214.45 No Bid No Bid

Category A (Automotive)--Grand Total $ 20,236.56 19,769.68 20,800.09 4,353.04 3,634.25
Less Autozone No Bid Items (V-2,V-4,VII-2) 1,699.50 0.00 1,466.00 0.00 0.00

Total (w/out 3 No Bid Items) $ 18,537.06 19,769.68 19,334.09 4,353.04 3,634.25

Category B--Truck Parts
I-1 20 ea Work Light, Grote 64931 8.79 175.80 No Bid 10.38 207.60 8.06 161.20 6.57 131.40
2 15 ea License Plate Light Signal, Stat 430W 2.32 34.80 2.98 44.70 2.03 30.45 2.08 31.20 1.59 23.85
3 10 ea License Plate Light Signal, Stat 431W 3.33 33.30 4.98 49.80 3.01 30.10 2.88 28.80 2.19 21.90
4 50 ea Tail light, Trucklite 40282R 3.99 199.50 No Bid 4.46 223.00 2.71 135.50 1.89 94.50
5 30 ea Clearance Light Signal, Stat 1010A 1.49 44.70 3.93 117.90 1.65 49.50 1.55 46.50 0.99 29.70
6 20 ea Back-up Light Signal, Stat 4043W 2.99 59.80 1.98 39.60 6.56 131.20 6.51 130.20 3.48 69.60
7 10 ea Back-up Alarm, Star 60-107-12 24.00 240.00 No Bid 19.78 197.80 28.17 281.70 23.74 237.40

II-1 35 ea Air filter, Baldwin PA 2326 61.62 2,156.70 No Bid 54.43 1,905.05 55.07 1,927.45 50.77 1,776.95
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2 30 ea Oil filter, Baldwin BD 103 18.89 566.70 No Bid 17.56 526.80 15.95 478.50 15.76 472.80
3 28 ea Oil filter, Baldwin B 7577 10.56 295.68 No Bid 9.82 274.96 9.01 252.28 9.41 263.48
4 22 ea Air filter, Baldwin PA 2358 4.56 100.32 No Bid 21.17 465.74 21.31 468.82 18.88 415.36
5 35 ea Oil filter, Baldwin BD 7153 34.53 1,208.55 No Bid 30.50 1,067.50 23.56 824.60 27.54 963.90
6 50 ea Oil filter, Baldwin 7600 4.71 235.50 No Bid 4.24 212.00 4.30 215.00 4.09 204.50
7 24 ea Fuel filter, Baldwin BF 1212 7.07 169.68 No Bid 6.57 157.68 6.53 156.72 6.04 144.96
8 36 ea Oil filter, Baldwin BT 259 2.47 88.92 No Bid 2.48 89.28 2.59 93.24 2.43 87.48
9 45 ea Oil filter, Baldwin BF 988 4.02 180.90 No Bid 3.74 168.30 3.67 165.15 3.41 153.45

III-1 48 ea Rear brake shoes, #4515Q 11.91 571.68 No Bid 29.13 1,398.24 15.22 730.56 12.79 613.92
2 12 ea Front drum, Webb #65162 99.99 1,199.88 No Bid 116.45 1,397.40 87.81 1,053.72 97.12 1,165.44
3 12 ea Brake chamber, Type #3030 39.99 479.88 No Bid 35.88 430.56 41.98 503.76 33.50 402.00
4 4 ea Governor air brake, Bendix #275491 15.29 61.16 No Bid 22.40 89.60 15.23 60.92 9.95 39.80
5 32 ea Rear drum, Webb #66884 69.95 2,238.40 No Bid 65.81 2,105.92 68.53 2,192.96 59.00 1,888.00
6 28 ea Brake kits, Batco 8-1088 8.47 237.16 No Bid 9.12 255.36 6.40 179.20 4.62 129.36
7 6 ea Hub caps, Stemco #343-4009 9.99 59.94 No Bid 11.86 71.16 10.32 61.92 5.95 35.70

Category B (Truck)--Grand Total $ 10,638.95 252.00 11,485.20 10,179.90 9,365.45

Grand Total Bid (Cat. A & B) $ 30,875.51$    20,021.68$    32,285.29$    14,532.94$    12,999.70$    

 Staff Award Recommendation (Total low bid by category)
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I38Cell:
jpolasek:Comment:
O'Reilly: Cat A, Sect 5, Item 5--$23.19 (Rear), $31.93 (Front)

I47Cell:
jpolasek:Comment:
O'Reilly: Cat A, Sect 7, Item 4--quoting Delphi
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