
City of College Station
Bid Tabulation

ANNUAL BID FOR PVC PIPE / FITTINGS 
DEPARTMENT: ELECTRICAL INVENTORY
BID:  #03-54

CENTRAL ELECTRIC DEALERS ELECTRIC K B S ELECTRIC TECHLINE WARD ELECTRIC
Bryan, TX Bryan, TX Bryan, TX Austin, TX Conroe, TX
Contact: Joe Bomnskie Contact: Ronnie Holder Contact: Marvin Oldham Contact: Kelly McGill Contact: Cathy Sams

Item Est. Unit Inventory # Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item
No. Quan. Meas. Description Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

PVC Fittings
1 4,000 EA 285-019-00007 PVC, Sch 40, Coupling, 2", Long Type 0.870 3,480.00 0.93 3,720.00 0.79 3,160.00 No Bid 0.75 3,000.00
2 500 EA 285-019-00008 PVC, Sch 40, Coupling, 4", Long Type 4.034 2,016.75 4.31 2,155.00 2.20 1,100.00 No Bid 3.10 1,550.00
3 200 EA 285-019-00018 PVC, Sch 40, Coupling, 3" 2.990 598.00 3.21 642.00 1.75 350.00 No Bid 2.25 450.00
4 40 EA 285-019-00021 PVC, Elbow, 22 1/2 Degree Bend, 3" 19.950 798.00 14.71 588.40 4.10 164.00 No Bid No Bid
5 30 EA 285-019-00028 Elbow, Sch 40, 36" Sp.Radius, 6", 45 30.800 924.00 32.95 988.50 25.80 774.00 No Bid 25.00 750.00
6 200 EA 285-019-00031 Plugs w/Pull Tabs, 4" 0.840 168.00 0.89 178.00 0.98 196.00 No Bid 0.87 174.00
7 200 EA 285-019-00032 Plugs w/Pull Tabs, 6" 1.210 242.00 1.30 260.00 1.51 302.00 No Bid 1.35 270.00
8 200 EA 285-019-00033 Sch 40, End Caps, 2" 1.120 224.00 1.20 240.00 1.44 288.00 No Bid 1.38 276.00
9 100 EA 285-019-00034 Sch 40, End Caps, 3" 3.050 305.00 3.25 325.00 3.24 324.00 No Bid 3.08 308.00
10 200 EA 285-019-00035 Sch 40, End Caps, 4" 6.340 1,268.00 6.78 1,356.00 6.70 1,340.00 No Bid 6.20 1,240.00
11 300 EA 285-019-00037 Locknut, Male Adapter, 1" 0.096 28.80 0.10 30.00 0.12 36.00 No Bid 0.10 30.00
12 300 EA 285-019-00038 Bushing, Plastic, 1" 0.090 26.85 0.09 27.00 0.10 30.00 No Bid 0.09 27.00
13 300 EA 285-019-00039 PVC, Adapter, Male, 1" 0.180 54.00 0.19 57.00 0.27 81.00 No Bid 0.23 69.00
14 300 EA 285-019-00040 Locknut, Male Adapter, 2" 0.274 82.05 0.27 81.00 0.31 93.00 No Bid 0.28 84.00
15 300 EA 285-019-00041 Bushing, Plastic, 2" 0.273 81.75 0.26 78.00 0.30 90.00 No Bid 0.28 84.00
16 300 EA 285-019-00042 PVC, Male Aapter, 2" 0.464 139.05 0.50 150.00 0.56 168.00 No Bid 0.51 153.00
17 200 EA 285-019-00043 Locknut, Male Adapter, 4" 1.435 287.00 1.41 282.00 1.55 310.00 No Bid 1.58 316.00
18 200 EA 285-019-00044 Bushing, Plastic, 4" 0.812 162.40 0.70 140.00 0.83 166.00 No Bid 0.84 168.00
19 200 EA 285-019-00045 PVC, Male Adapter, 4" 2.060 412.00 2.21 442.00 2.35 470.00 No Bid 2.16 432.00
20 30 EA 285-019-00046 PVC, Male Adapter, 6" 4.900 147.00 5.24 157.20 5.45 163.50 No Bid 5.12 153.60
21 5,000 FT 285-019-00047 PVC, Sch 40, Roll Conduit Pipe, 1" 0.308 1,540.00 No Bid 0.36 1,800.00 0.32 1,600.00 0.34 1,700.00
22 10,000 FT 285-019-00048 PVC, Sch 40, Roll Conduit Pipe, 2" 0.385 3,850.00 No Bid 0.64 6,400.00 0.56 5,600.00 0.59 5,900.00
23 6,000 FT 285-019-00013 PVC, Sch 80, Roll Conduit Pipe, 4" 1.353 8,118.00 No Bid 1.76 10,560.00 1.84 11,040.00 1.95 11,700.00
24 2,500 FT 285-019-00049 PVC, Sch 80, Roll conduit Pipe, 6" 3.960 9,900.00 No Bid 4.30 10,750.00 4.56 11,400.00 4.79 11,975.00

Grand Total Bid $ 34,852.65$       11,897.10$       39,115.50$       29,640.00$       40,809.60$       

Award Total to Vendor $ 23,408.00$       1,288.00$         1,614.00$         6,057.60$         

Total Award $--All Vendors 32,367.600

 Staff Award Recommendation: Staff recommends rejecting all bids.  No Vendors are able to honor bid prices due to volatile market created by war with Iraq.
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