
ANNUAL BID FOR STREET SIGNS/POSTS
DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS--TRAFFIC DIV. 
BID:  #03-50

HALL SIGNS, INC. ALLIED TUBE ROCAL, INC. NORTHWEST PIPE CO. TRAFFIC SAFETY BRKTS VULCAN SIGNS SIGNS & BLANKS, INC. PATHMARK TRAFFIC OSBURN ASSOCIATES
Bloomington, IN Harvey, IL Frankfort, OH Houston, TX Green Forest, AR Foley, AL Akron, OH San Marcos, TX Cleburne, TX
Contact: Christina Miller Contact: Ron Kress Contact: David Lightle Contact: Stuart Cole Contact: Tim Mattingly Contact: Erick Crosby Contact: Matt Coddington Contact: Rick Brushaber Contact: Jeff Osburn

Item Est. Unit Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item
No. Quan. Meas. Description Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
1 100 EA Aluminum Sign Blanks, .080 x 18 x 24 8.98 898.00 No Bid 8.17 817.00 No Bid No Bid 8.35 835.00 7.68 768.00 8.82 882.00 8.10 810.00
2 500 EA Aluminum Sign Blanks, .080 x 12 x 18 4.74 2,370.00 No Bid 4.08 2,040.00 No Bid No Bid 3.93 1,965.00 3.84 1,920.00 4.41 2,205.00 4.05 2,025.00
3 100 EA Aluminum Sign Blanks, .080 x 24 x 30 14.51 1,451.00 No Bid 13.62 1,362.00 No Bid No Bid 12.35 1,235.00 12.80 1,280.00 14.70 1,470.00 13.50 1,350.00
4 300 EA Sign Blanks, Square, .080 x 30 x 30 18.05 5,415.00 No Bid 17.33 5,199.00 No Bid No Bid 15.44 4,632.00 15.89 4,767.00 18.37 5,511.00 16.50 4,950.00
5 50 EA Aluminum Sign Blanks, .080 x 48 x 24 23.47 1,173.50 No Bid 22.18 1,109.00 No Bid No Bid 19.76 988.00 20.48 1,024.00 23.52 1,176.00 20.80 1,040.00
6 20 RL Reflective Sheeting, 6" X 50 yd rl, white 67.00 1,340.00 No Bid 56.46 1,129.20 No Bid No Bid 62.90 1,258.00 59.25 1,185.00 68.82 1,376.40 65.00 1,300.00
7 300 EA Triangular Slip Base System, 3" dia No Bid No Bid No Bid 65.99 19,797.00 No Bid 78.27 23,481.00 No Bid No Bid 69.00 20,700.00

7-a 50 EA Replacement Posts, 12' X 2 7/8", OD No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.42 821.00 No Bid 20.69 1,034.50 No Bid No Bid 17.50 875.00
7-b 50 EA Bolt Retainer Plate, w/POZ LOC No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.22 161.00 No Bid 3.64 182.00 No Bid No Bid 7.00 350.00
7-c 200 EA Pipe Sign Clamps, 2 1/2" No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.80 360.00 No Bid 1.98 396.00 No Bid No Bid 3.00 600.00
8 10 EA "School Bus Stop Ahead", .080X36X36 67.97 679.70 No Bid 66.70 667.00 No Bid No Bid 63.93 639.30 66.15 661.50 69.88 698.80 70.65 706.50
9 100 EA Sign Blanks, Octagon, .080X30X30 9.73 973.00 No Bid 9.09 909.00 No Bid No Bid 9.11 911.00 8.75 875.00 10.17 1,017.00 9.37 937.00
10 200 EA Faces "NO PARKING ANYTIME" 4.74 948.00 No Bid 4.16 832.00 No Bid No Bid 3.93 786.00 3.84 768.00 5.51 1,102.00 4.35 870.00
11 40 EA Faces "NO PARKING THIS SIDE---" 4.74 189.60 No Bid 4.16 166.40 No Bid No Bid 3.93 157.20 3.84 153.60 5.51 220.40 4.35 174.00
12 50 EA Faces "NO PKG STOPG STNDG---" 4.74 237.00 No Bid 4.16 208.00 No Bid No Bid 5.44 272.00 3.85 192.50 5.51 275.50 4.35 217.50
13 60 EA Faces "NO PARKING HERE TO ---" 4.74 284.40 No Bid 4.16 249.60 No Bid No Bid 3.93 235.80 3.84 230.40 5.51 330.60 4.35 261.00
14 200 EA Faces "TOW AWAY ZONE" 1.91 382.00 No Bid 1.50 300.00 No Bid No Bid 1.84 368.00 1.48 296.00 2.05 410.00 1.55 310.00
15 40 EA Faces "SCHOOL ADVANCE" 46.49 1,859.60 No Bid 45.57 1,822.80 No Bid No Bid 42.04 1,681.60 45.94 1,837.60 48.52 1,940.80 49.06 1,962.40
16 40 EA Faces "SCHOOL CROSSING" 46.49 1,859.60 No Bid 45.57 1,822.80 No Bid No Bid 42.04 1,681.60 45.94 1,837.60 48.52 1,940.80 49.06 1,962.40
17 50 EA Faces "STOP AHEAD" 18.05 902.50 No Bid 17.33 866.50 No Bid No Bid 15.63 781.50 15.99 799.50 23.01 1,150.50 19.37 968.50
18 50 EA Sign "STOP", Eng. Grade 46.10 2,305.00 No Bid 43.11 2,155.50 No Bid No Bid 36.24 1,812.00 42.40 2,120.00 44.44 2,222.00 44.00 2,200.00
19 100 EA Sign "STOP", Diamond Grade Sheeting 42.16 4,216.00 No Bid 41.15 4,115.00 No Bid No Bid 39.57 3,957.00 39.09 3,909.00 59.55 5,955.00 44.68 4,468.00
20 400 EA Brackets, Cross (1/8" Channel) 2.89 1,156.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 4.05 1,620.00 3.94 1,576.00 No Bid 3.44 1,376.00 3.02 1,208.00
21 500 EA Brackets, Round Cap 3.02 1,510.00 No Bid 3.60 1,800.00 No Bid 4.15 2,075.00 3.94 1,970.00 No Bid 3.55 1,775.00 3.02 1,510.00
22 800 EA Brackets, Stop Sign, Cast Iron No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.84 1,472.00 No Bid No Bid 3.02 2,416.00
23 500 EA Posts, Round Sign, Brown, 12'X2 3/8" No Bid 17.60 8,800.00 No Bid 14.84 7,420.00 No Bid 12.07 6,035.00 No Bid No Bid 15.30 7,650.00
24 400 EA Posts, Channel, Brown, 9', 2#/ft No Bid 17.35 6,940.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.77 5,508.00 No Bid No Bid 15.08 6,032.00
25 200 EA Posts, Channel, Brown, 10', 2#/ft No Bid 18.90 3,780.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.64 2,928.00 No Bid No Bid 16.41 3,282.00
26 400 EA Posts, Channel, Brown, 3', 2#/ft No Bid 11.01 4,404.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.09 2,836.00 No Bid No Bid 9.05 3,620.00
27 150 EA Plates, Street Name, Extr, 9" X 48" 17.95 2,692.50 No Bid 15.56 2,334.00 No Bid No Bid 15.12 2,268.00 16.95 2,542.50 18.63 2,794.50 15.10 2,265.00
28 100 EA Plates, Street Name, Extr, 9" X 42" 15.78 1,578.00 No Bid 13.61 1,361.00 No Bid No Bid 13.23 1,323.00 14.83 1,483.00 16.30 1,630.00 13.45 1,345.00
29 100 EA Plates, Street Name, Extr, 9" X 36" 13.60 1,360.00 No Bid 11.67 1,167.00 No Bid No Bid 11.34 1,134.00 12.71 1,271.00 13.97 1,397.00 11.82 1,182.00
30 100 EA Plates, Street Name, Extr, 9" X 30" 11.13 1,113.00 No Bid 9.72 972.00 No Bid No Bid 9.45 945.00 10.59 1,059.00 11.64 1,164.00 10.18 1,018.00
31 100 EA Plates, Street Name, Extr, 6" X 42" 11.19 1,119.00 No Bid 10.31 1,031.00 No Bid No Bid 9.31 931.00 9.89 989.00 11.52 1,152.00 11.08 1,108.00
32 250 EA Plates, Street Name, Extr, 6" X 36" 9.62 2,405.00 No Bid 8.83 2,207.50 No Bid No Bid 7.98 1,995.00 8.48 2,120.00 9.88 2,470.00 9.77 2,442.50
33 500 EA Plates, Street Name, Extr, 6" X 30" 8.07 4,035.00 No Bid 7.36 3,680.00 No Bid No Bid 6.65 3,325.00 7.06 3,530.00 8.23 4,115.00 8.47 4,235.00
34 50 EA Sign, 15" X 7', w/High Intensity Green 49.32 2,466.00 No Bid 39.53 1,976.50 No Bid No Bid 54.31 2,715.50 33.69 1,684.50 No Bid 47.12 2,356.00
35 50 EA Sign, 15" X 6', w/High Intensity Green 42.68 2,134.00 No Bid 33.88 1,694.00 No Bid No Bid 46.55 2,327.50 28.88 1,444.00 No Bid 41.25 2,062.50
36 50 EA Sign, 15" X 5', w/High Intensity Green 36.41 1,820.50 No Bid 28.24 1,412.00 No Bid No Bid 38.79 1,939.50 24.10 1,205.00 No Bid 34.37 1,718.50
37 25 EA Sign Blanks, .080 X 24" X 24" 11.74 293.50 No Bid 6.16 154.00 No Bid No Bid 6.54 163.50 6.04 151.00 7.29 182.25 6.00 150.00
38 50 EA Bike Sign, 24" X 30", Engineer Grade 14.51 725.50 No Bid 13.87 693.50 No Bid No Bid 12.42 621.00 12.80 640.00 19.56 978.00 14.95 747.50
39 50 EA Bike Route, 24" X 18", Engineer Grade 8.98 449.00 No Bid 8.32 416.00 No Bid No Bid 7.45 372.50 7.68 384.00 11.73 586.50 8.97 448.50
40 50 EA Left Turn Yield on Green Ball, 24" X 30" 14.51 725.50 No Bid 14.29 714.50 No Bid No Bid 13.15 657.50 13.80 690.00 22.35 1,117.50 14.95 747.50

Grand Total Bid $ 53,066.40$    23,924.00$    47,383.80$    28,559.00$    3,695.00$      92,332.50$    43,817.70$    50,621.55$    96,581.30$    

Vendor Award Total $ 1,129.20$      21,139.00$    43,534.00$    13,446.00$    5,133.00$      

Total Award $--All Vendors $84,381.20

 Award Recommendation
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O21Cell:
jpolasek:Comment:
Item 8: Vulcan Signs--bid fluorescent yellow green VIP

O28Cell:
jpolasek:Comment:
Item 15: Vulcan Signs--bid fluorescent yellow green VIP

O29Cell:
jpolasek:Comment:
Item 16: Vulcan Signs--bid fluorescent yellow green VIP

E33Cell:
jpolasek:Comment:
Item 20: Hall Signs--minimum order of 1,000 lb total shipment--No award--City unable to meet minimum order requirements--awarded to next lowest bidder.

O33Cell:
jpolasek:Comment:
Item 20: Vulcan Signs--bid SUPR-LOK #990X Cross

E34Cell:
jpolasek:Comment:
Item 21: Hall Signs--minimum order of 1,000 lb total shipment.  City unable to meet minimum order requirements--awarded to next lowest bidder.

O34Cell:
jpolasek:Comment:
Item 21: Vulcan Signs--bid SUPR-LOK #922X CAP

O36Cell:
jpolasek:Comment:
Item 23: Vulcan Signs--minimum order 300 posts.

O37Cell:
jpolasek:Comment:
Item 24: Vulcan Signs--minimum order 300 posts total (combination) 

O38Cell:
jpolasek:Comment:
Item 25: Vulcan Signs--minimum order 300 posts total (combination)

O39Cell:
jpolasek:Comment:
Item 26: Vulcan Signs--minimum order 300 posts total (combination).  Also bid 3'-6" posts.

O40Cell:
jpolasek:Comment:
Item 27: Vulcan Signs--bid engineer grade sheeting both sides

O47Cell:
jpolasek:Comment:
Item 34: Vulcan Signs--bid .100 gauge aluminum w/high intensity sheeting & border, 1 side only.

O48Cell:
jpolasek:Comment:
Item 35: Vulcan Signs--bid .100 gauge aluminum w/high intensity sheeting & border, 1 side only.

O49Cell:
jpolasek:Comment:
Item 36: Vulcan Signs--bid .100 gauge aluminum w/high intensity sheeting & border, 1 side only.
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