ANNUAL BID FOR PVC PIPE & FITTINGS
DEPARTMENT: Electrical Inventory

City of College Station
Bid Tabulation

BID: #03-39
Alamo Iron Works Central Electrical Supply Dealers Electrical Supply |KBS Electrical Supply Ward Electric Supply
San Antonio, TX Bryan, TX Bryan, TX Bryan, TX Conroe, TX
Contact: Larry Balmos Contact: Joe Bomnskie Contact: Ronnie Holder Contact: Marvin Oldham Contact: Cathy Sams
Jten] AnnuallﬂUnit Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item
No.| Qty EstMeas Description Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
Group I: PVC Fittings
1 160] EA |PVC, Sch 40, 90 Degree, Bend, 1" 0.2500 40.00 0.4350 69.60 0.43 68.80 0.45 72.00 0.44 70.40
2 320| EA |PVC, Sch 40, 45 Degree, Bend, 2" 0.9000 288.00 1.0790 345.28 1.07 342.40 1.12 358.40 1.08 345.60
3 1,000| EA [PVC, Sch 40, 90 Degree, Bend, 2" 0.7700 770.00 1.1390 1,139.00 1.17 1,170.00 1.20 1,200.00 1.14 1,140.00
4 50| EA [PVC, Sch 40, 45 Degree, Bend, 4" 6.5500 327.50 5.8170 290.85 5.77 288.50 5.65 282.50 6.75 337.50
5 260| EA |PVC, Sch 40, 90 Degree, Bend, 4" 5.0500 1,313.00 6.0350 1,569.10 6.01 1,562.60 5.99 1,557.40 7.20 1,872.00
6 260| EA |PVC, Sch 40, Coupling, 1" 0.2100 54.60 0.1315 34.19 0.14 36.40 0.16 41.60 0.15 37.70
7 20| EA |PVC, Sch 40, 22 1/2 Degree, Bend, 4" No Bid 6.2800 125.60 6.46 129.20 6.45 129.00 7.29 145.80
8 20| EA |PVC< Sch 40, Coupling, 6" 7.3500 147.00 4.7000 94.00 4.79 95.80 4.70 94.00 4.73 94.60
9 40| EA |PVC, Sch 40, Elbow, 90 Degree Bend, 6" 16.0500 642.00 26.7200 1,068.80 17.84 713.60 26.40 1,056.00 56.79 2,271.60
10 100] EA [PVC, Sch 40, Elbow, 90 Degree Bend, 3" 2.8200 282.00 9.5700 957.00 3.49 349.00 8.45 845.00 13.00 1,300.00
11 100] EA [PVC, Sch 40, Elbow, 45 Degree Bend, 3" 3.6700 367.00 8.4000 840.00 3.32 332.00 8.05 805.00 11.44 1,144.00
12 50| EA [Elbow, Sch 40, 36" Special Radius, 6" No Bid 33.7300 1,686.50 22.50 1,125.00 14.85 742.50 20.40 1,020.00
13 400| EA |Plugs, w/Pull Tabs, 2" No Bid 0.7850 314.00 0.41 164.00 0.84 336.00 0.41 164.00
14 100| EA |Plugs, w/Pull Tabs, 3" No Bid 0.8760 87.60 0.55 55.00 0.90 90.00 0.57 57.30
15 100] EA [Sch 40 & 80, End Caps, 6" No Bid 10.2100 1,021.00 11.98 1,198.00 10.40 1,040.00 12.24 1,224.00
Group |--Sub Total $ 4,231.10 9,642.52 7,630.30 8,649.40 11,224.50
Group II: PVC Pipe
1 10,000{ FT |PVC Sch 40, Pipe, 1", 10 ft/section 0.2400 2,400.00 0.2090 2,090.00 0.18 1,800.00 0.24 2,400.00 0.15 1,510.00
2 | 100,000{ FT |PVC Sch 40, Pipe, 2", 10 ft/section 0.4900 49,000.00 0.3895 38,950.00 0.33 33,000.00 0.36 36,000.00 0.30 30,000.00
3 5,000 FT |PVC Sch 40, Pipe, 3", 10 ft/section 0.9000 4,500.00 0.8720 4,360.00 0.66 3,300.00 0.72 3,600.00 0.61 3,045.00
3 | 20,000 FT |PVC Sch 40, Pipe, 4", 10 ft/section 1.2700 25,400.00 1.1265 22,530.00 0.91 18,200.00 0.94 18,800.00 0.85 17,000.00
4 15,000 FT |PVC Sch 40, Pipe, 6", Gray, 10 ft/section 2.3800 35,700.00 2.1443 32,164.50 1.67 25,050.00 1.78 26,700.00 1.62 24,300.00
Group II--Sub Total $ 117,000.00 100,094.50 81,350.00 87,500.00 75,855.00
Group lll: PVC Pipe

1 1,000| FT |Conduit, Intermediate Metal, 1", 10 ft/sect No Bid 0.9595 959.50 0.68 680.00 0.74 740.00 0.77 770.00
2 3,000] FT [Conduit, Intermediate Metal, 2", 10 ft/sect No Bid 1.7345 5,203.50 1.39 4,170.00 1.46 4,380.00 1.56 4,680.00
3 200| FT |Conduit, Intermediate Metal, 3", 10 ft/sect No Bid 4.8500 970.00 3.77 754.00 3.96 792.00 4.29 858.00
4 500| FT |Conduit, Intermediate Metal, 4", 10 ft/sect No Bid 6.6500 3,325.00 5.14 2,570.00 5.40 2,700.00 5.80 2,900.00
5 200| FT |Conduit, Intermediate Metal, 6", 10 ft/sect No Bid 12.7600 2,552.00 8.88 1,776.00 No Bid 11.40 2,280.00
Group lllI--Sub Total $ 0.00 13,010.00 9,950.00 8,612.00 11,488.00
Grand Total Bid $ $ 121,231.10 $ 122,747.02 98,930.30 104,761.40 $ 98,567.50
Total Award by Group to Each Vendor $ 17,580.30 $ 75,855.00

Staff Award Recommendation
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